Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Public Spaces Protection Orders
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Whether you have introduced any Public Spaces Protection Orders since June 2017. If so, please include the text of these PSPOs. 
Answer:
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, i.e. the Council Website, as it is already in the public domain. 

Please follow the attached link for Leicester City Council’s PSPO for street drinking and New Psychotic Substances:

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/182151/public-space-protection-order-pspo-2017.pdf
Please state whether you have plans to introduce a PSPO in the near future.

The Council do not have any plans to introduce a PSPO in the near future


2. Please provide the number of fines and prosecutions issued for the offence of violation of a PSPO, in the year 2018. Please if possible give the offences for which the fines/prosecutions were issued.
If you have used dispersal powers contained in a PSPO, please include any statistics on how these powers have been used.

PSPO Failed to Remove Faeces = 6

PSPO Permitting Dog to Enter Land Excluding Dogs = 1

3. Please provide the number of Community Protection Notices (CPNs) issued in the years:

November 2016 - October 2017 = 45
November 2017 - October 2018 = 77


4. Please where possible provide the text/subject of these CPNs.

The requested information is not recorded in a reportable format by the Council.  To collate this information would require a manual trawl of every notice issued for the period in question.

This exercise would exceed the cost limit prescribed in the Freedom of Information Act.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, along with locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The Council has duly determined that to undertake such an exercise would exceed the limit specified above.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

CPNs are issued for various issues, each individual to the situation and may include a number of issues on each CPN. The list below shows what issues CPNs have been issued for:
Accumulation of rubbish on land

Fly posting

Fly tipping

Japanese Knot Weed

Highways Obstruction

Overgrown Land/gardens

Graffiti removal

Dog Control/fouling on private land

Street Entertainers

Noise

5. Please provide the number of fines issued by your authority for the offence of littering in the year 2018.

317


6. Please state whether you contract a private company for the issuing of fines for PSPOs or littering. If so, please state the company and the contract arrangements.

The Council does not contract a private company for the issuing of fines for PSPOs or littering.

7. Please give the number of fines/warnings issued for fly posting in 2018, and whether any of these have been issued to political/charitable/religious/ community groups.

151 Fixed Penalty Notices issued 
These are issued to individuals or businesses.  Other than the name we do not record data relating to the type of organisation or the persons affiliations.

As such, the requested information is not held by Leicester City Council and we are informing you of this as required by the provision of Section 1(1) of the FOIA.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


