Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

I would like to ask for information regarding the connectivity in your local area covered by Leicester council. A connectivity project referred to below is any project aimed to improve broadband, phone signal or other type of internet connection in your region.

 

1. How many council buildings have access to superfast broadband? Please specify an amount
Nil.

2. Have you invested in connectivity projects aimed at improving local council offered services in the last 12 months?
No.
a. If no, do you have plans for future projects? 
Yes
b. If yes, how much has been invested so far? Please specify an amount
Nil.
c. If yes, can you provide any details of these plans? Please specify any projects you are working on.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

