Freedom of Information Act 2000 – complaints about care workers
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1) How many complaints did you receive from 2013-2019 (up until 11/2/2019) relating to care workers failing to show up when expected for a domiciliary home visit? I would like this information broken down by month and year please.
2) How often did care workers officially cancel visits from 2013-2019 (up until 11/2/2019)? I would like this information broken down by month and year please. 
3) How often were care workers officially documented as being late to a home visit from 2013-2019 (up until 11/2/2019)? I would like this information broken down by month and year please. 
4) How late were care workers to home visits from 2013-2019 (up until 11/2/2019)? If this information is available could I please have it broken down into the following categories: one hour late, two hours late, four hours late. I would also like this information broken down by month and year please.
5) How many complaints did you receive from 2013-2019 (up until 11/2/2019) in regard to care workers being late to home visits? I would like this information broken down by month and year please. 
Answer: 

In response to questions 1-5

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This information is not recorded in a reportable format; therefore, each complaint would need to be scrutinised. The service has calculated that based on the number of complaints received in the first month of 2019, the service receives approximately 324 complaints per year. Missed calls, late calls etc. are often not the sole reason for a complaint, and there is no way to filter complaints by the single ‘nature’ of a complaint. This would mean an examination of each complaint manually, taking approximately 10 minutes. Therefore, the service estimates it would take 54 hours to complete one year’s manual examination of complaint records.”

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

6) How many care workers do you currently employ who make domiciliary home visits? Could I have the numbers from 2013 to 2019 (up until 11/2/2019)?


We do not hold this information. The Council contracts with private providers who supply services beyond the contractual requirement to private and other local authority / health funded clients. 

Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

7) How many domiciliary home visits were made from 2013 to 2019 (up until 11/2/2019)?
Please break these figures down by month and year.
We do not hold this information. The Council contracts with private providers who supply services beyond the contractual requirement to private and other local authority / health funded clients. 

Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
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