Freedom of Information Act 2000 – customer relationship management
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
Q1. What is the full official name of the Authority? 

Answer: Leicester City Council

Q2. How large is the Authority in terms of population?
Q3. How large is the Authority in terms of geographical boundaries? 
In respect of Qs 2 and 3, this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain:
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/about-us/about-leicester/
https://www.ons.gov.uk/  

https://mapit.mysociety.org/area/2564.html
Q4. How many information systems / databases does the Authority use? 

There are currently 569 ‘In service’ systems/applications/databases listed on the Council’s SCSM (System Centre Service Manager) system
Q4a. How many of those are stand-alone (i.e. do not interact with any other information system)? 

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Taking a sample, however, of the 38 higher priority (gold and silver rated) applications supported by the Corporate Application Support Team there are: 
Interfaces with more than 1 other system:

12
(32%)

Interfaces with 1 other system:



9 
(24%)

No Interfaces:





17
(45%)

Q4b. How many of those interact with at least one other system (e.g. using API calls)? 

See response to Q4a

Q4c. Are the systems mainly centred around Residents or Properties?

Each system is different, and can be either, both or none of those.  

Some are customer centric and some property based.  As would be expected many systems are generally interested in customers (citizen or resident) but contain property data that is also vital.

Q5. What services are provided to Residents by the Authority (e.g. Taxi Licensing, Waste, Education, Planning Applications, etc.) 

This information is already in the public domain, i.e. it is published on the Council’s website at https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/services/ 

This is therefore a refusal as exemption Section 21 of the Act applies.

Q6a. Does the Authority have an online portal for Residents? 

Yes

Q6b. If it does, what is the uptake (as a percentage) across the authority?

The Council can advise that up to February 2019 the uptake is 64,230.  However, the uptake is not held as a percentage and is therefore informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the Act.
Q6c. What is the uptake by residents as a percentage within the authority?
The uptake refers to the percentage of residents who are signed up to the council's online portal.
The Council does not hold this information and is advising you as required by Section 1(1) of the Act.
Q7. What percentage of services in Q4 are accessible to Residents online using Single Sign On (SSO) on the portal? 

None

Q8. What was the Authority’s annual spend for 2017-18? 

This is a refusal notice as exemption Section 21 of the Act applies.  This information is published on the Council’s website:
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/performance-and-spending/budget-summaries/
Q9. What was the Authority’s annual spend for 2017-18 for software licensing? 

Including all operational licences such as MS and servers, £3,220,622.23

Q10. What was the Authority’s annual spend for 2017-18 for payroll of employees, agency staff, and contractors? 
Clarification: Q10 refers to the full paybill (so employees, agency workers, and contractors directly contracted by the council). Where there are employees employed by a third-party sub-contractor (Amey, Capita, etc.), these do not need to be included.
LCC Employees
£152,902,166
Agency

£11,098,380

Q11. Does the Authority use a Customer Relationship Management (CRM) System? 
(if Yes answer Q12, if No answer Q13) 

Yes 

Q12. If the Authority has a CRM system: 
Q12a. When did the CRM system go Live? 

January 2017
Q12b. How long did the implementation take? 

3 months
Q12c. What were the main obstacles encountered to the implementation? (See "CRM Challenges" below, please state all that apply) 

The Council does not hold this information and as such is informing you in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held. 

Q13. If the Authority does not have a CRM system: 
Q13a. Has the implementation of a CRM ever been considered?
Q13b. If Yes to Q13a., what were the reasons for not proceeding? (See "CRM Challenges" below, please state all that apply) 
Q13c. Has the implementation of a CRM ever been planned or undertaken, but subsequently abandoned?
Q13d. If Yes to Q13c., what were the reasons for the failure of the project? (See "CRM Challenges" below, please state all that apply)
Not applicable

Q14. Are the IT systems centred primarily around Residents or Properties?

This is a repeat of Q4c so please refer to that response

CRM Challenges 
Integration of different data sources into a single system 
Training users to effectively use the solution 
Participation of different departments within the authority 
Integration with existing back-office applications 
Promoting Usage 
Funding 
Other (please specify)

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


