Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. How many Freedom of Information requests were made of Leicester City Council in the most recent five years on record (figures for each year required)?
2014 – 1,315
2015 – 1,218
2016 – 1,371

2017 – 1,202

2018 – 1,103


2. Where do these requests come from? (e.g. how many are from newspapers, freelance journalists, businesses etc.)
Please see the table below for request received from 2014 to 2018.
	FOIA Request Sources
	 Total

(2014)
	 Total

(2015)
	Total (2016)
	Total (2017)
	Total (2018)

	Business
	 290
	 264
	286
	253
	242

	Councillor
	 2
	 3
	2
	3
	0

	Government Department
	 1
	 2
	108
	3
	1

	Member of Parliament
	 24
	 0
	24
	13
	17

	Member of Public
	 498
	 375
	410
	357
	365

	Other Local Authority
	 10
	 8
	14
	8
	2

	Police
	 1
	 0
	0
	0
	0

	Press/Media
	 206
	 236
	241
	239
	212

	Pressure Group
	 91
	 103
	77
	42
	44

	Solicitor
	 11
	 18
	15
	19
	11

	Student
	 41
	 50
	48
	85
	38

	Unions
	 6
	 4
	6
	10
	39

	Whatdotheyknow
	 115
	 131
	111
	107
	123

	Voluntary Sector
	 15
	 24
	29
	63
	58


3. How much did the Freedom of Information requests cost in each of the above years- is there a published report I could be sent a link to?

Nil in terms of charges for FOIA requests.
We do not record the amount of time staff spend logging, acknowledging and responding to FOI Act requests. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
As per the requirements of the FOIA code of practice, July 2018, FOIA statistics are accessible via the following link:

https://data.leicester.gov.uk/explore/dataset/freedom-of-information-foi-code/information/
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

