Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

This request relates to school pupils placed on part-time timetables* (also known as reduced time-tables or reduced educational provision) within your local authority area**. 

1. Please state the total number of pupils placed on part-time timetables within your local authority area across the entire school academic year a) 2015/16, b) 2016/17, c) 2017/18 and d) 2018/19 to date. 
The following totals of children had a part-time timetable for a period at some point during the academic years

a) 2015/16 – 85

b) 2016/17 – 151

c) 2017/18 – 113

d) 2018/19 to date - 70

2. If known, of the total number of pupils on part-time timetables across the entire school academic year 2017/18 (e.g. breakdown of 1.c), please state:
a) The total number of pupils placed on a part-time timetable with SEND (including SEND support and EHCPs)
62.

b) The total number of pupils placed on a part-time timetable because of risk of exclusion
14 children who were on part-time timetables also had one or more fixed term exclusion we cannot conclude that the part-time timetable was linked to this

c) The total number of pupils placed on a part-time timetable for more than a whole academic year 
There were 6 pupils. 

d) The total number of pupils placed on a part-time timetable without the formal consent of a parent/carer
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
*For the purposes of this request, a part-time time-table means an arrangement made with the pupil and parent/carer (with or without their approval) that the number of hours spent in education is reduced for an extended period of time. This does not include those on flexible learning programmes, whereby pupils attend alternative provision for some lessons but the total educational programme remains full-time. 

**If you only record this information for maintained schools, please provide this data.  

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

