Freedom of Information Act 2000 – social care appeals
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.
You asked:
1. Is there an appeals process* in place for when a service user (or their representative) disagrees with an assessment of their care and support needs or changes made to a package of care? 

* We are defining an appeals process as including the best practice set out in the Care Act 2014 under section 72: Part 1 appeals: 

(a) Who may (and may not) bring an appeal;

(b) Grounds on which an appeal may be brought;

(c) pre-conditions for bringing an appeal;

(d) How an appeal is to be brought and dealt with (including time limits);

(e) Who is to consider an appeal;

(f) Matters to be taken into account (and disregarded) by the person or body considering an appeal;

(g) Powers of the person or body deciding an appeal;

(h) What action is to be taken by a local authority as a result of an appeal decision;

(i) Providing information about the right to bring an appeal, appeal procedures and other sources of information and advice;

(j) Representation and support for an individual bringing or otherwise involved in an appeal;

(k) Investigations into things done or not done by a person or body with power to consider an appeal.

Answer:

Social Care & Education (adults) does not have a formal appeals process in place for when a service user (or their representative) disagrees with an assessment of their care and support needs or regarding changes made to a package of care. 
The Council therefore does not hold the information and is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the Act.

Individuals that wish to raise formal concerns about such matters will be directed to the Social Care complaint procedure that adheres to the ‘Local Authority Social Services and National Health Service Complaints (England) Regulations 2009’ instead and as referred to within the Care Act’s statutory guidance.

A copy of the current complaint regulations can be found at:

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi/2009/309/pdfs/uksi_20090309_en.pdf
As the enquiry below is specifically in relation to an appeals process rather than a complaint process, the points of this enquiry that can be responded to further are as follows:

Yes ☐   If “Yes” please answer questions 2 to 4

N/A

No ☐    If “No” please answer i to iii

i. What is the total number of occasions where a service user (or their representative) disagreed with an assessment of their care and support needs or changes made to their package of care? Please provide information from the most recent complete year of data you have
The total number of complaints recorded in relation to individuals disagreeing with either their assessment, their care and support needs or changes made to their package of care in 2017/18 = 16
ii. What proportion of these disagreements were accepted by your Local Authority? Please provide information from the most recent complete year of data you have
From the 16 complaints highlighted at ‘i’ above, 1 went on to be upheld under the complaint procedure in 2017/18.
iii. How do you respond to disagreements that have been raised by service users (or their representatives) when they have disagreed with an assessment of their needs or changes made to a package of care?

2. What other sources of national guidance or legislation helped inform and define your appeals process? Please provide sources for this information, such as links or copies
3. What time limit do you set to resolve appeals?

Should answering question 4 exceed the ‘appropriate limit’ under the FOI Act please prioritise questions 1 to 3 with regards to a response. 
4 i. What is the total number of occasions where a service user (or their representative) appealed an assessment of their care and support needs or changes made to their package of care? Please provide information from the most recent complete year of data you have
ii. What proportion of these disagreements were accepted by your Local Authority? Please provide information from the most recent complete year of data you have
In respect of Qs2-4, information in relation to formal appeals is not held by the Council and is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the Act 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


