Freedom of Information Act 2000 – asylum accommodation
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Please confirm what inspection duties your authority has in relation to the asylum accommodation in Leicester, which is provided under the Home Office’s COMPASS contract.
Answer:

Leicester City Council has a duty under The Housing Act 2004 to keep housing conditions in its area under review with a view to identifying any action that may need to be taken.  
Tenants in privately rented property (including asylum accommodation) can report any concerns they have about their accommodations to the council.  
The private sector housing team will investigate the reported issues and take the most appropriate action to ensure any identified hazards are reduced or removed.

2. Within your authority, who is responsible for conducting inspections into the suitability of asylum accommodation, and how often do these assessments take place?

The private sector housing team in regulatory services inspects privately rented property (including asylum accommodation) where a complaint is received about disrepair issues.   

3. Please confirm what legislation and/or standards are relied on to assess the condition and suitability of asylum accommodation as part of your inspection process.

· Part 1 of the Housing Act 2004: Housing Health and Safety Rating Scheme is used to assess whether hazards are present within a property.  Where Category 1 hazards are present an Improvement Notice is issued to the landlord/responsible person.

· Part 2 of the Housing Act 2004 licensing of houses in multiple occupations and Management of Houses in Multiple Occupation (England) Regulations 2006 govern the management of HMOs (including those used as part of the COMPASS contract)

· Licensing of Houses in Multiple Occupation (Mandatory Conditions of Licences) (England) Regulations 2018

· Local amenity and space standards for Houses in Multiple Occupation

4. Please confirm what sanctions, if any, are applied when asylum accommodation fails to meet the requisite standards during the inspection process.

Leicester City Council uses a graduated approach to enforcement. Enforcement options available include written or verbal advice, improvement notice, prohibition order, emergency action, prosecution.
5. From your records, please confirm how many complaints the Environmental Health team have received regarding the condition of and repairs required in asylum accommodation in Leicester.

Leicester City Council does not record this information as a distinct set within its systems.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


