Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information regarding hearing/sensory impairment care services.
Please note the data used in this response is for Directly Commissioned care packages. 

Q1. Please could you supply the name, job title, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for care for adults with sensory/hearing impairment.
Kate Galoppi, Head of Commissioning.

Kate.Galoppi@leicester.gov.uk Tel: 0116 454 2373 

 

For questions 2 through 8, please supply the following information for the financial years 2014/15 to 2017/18, and where possible, the budget or most up to date snapshot available for 2018/19.
 

Q2. Please provide the total number of adults with a sensory impairment in care placements funded by the local authority

 

Q3. Of the total number of adults with a sensory impairment in care placements funded by the local authority (Q2), please provide the total number of those with a hearing impairment 

 

Q4. Of the total number of adults with a hearing impairment in care placements funded by the local authority (Q3), please provide the total number of those with a hearing impairment and an additional care need or diagnosis (including but not limited to learning/physical disability, mental health, dementia, neuro-disability, challenging behaviour)

 

Q5. Please provide the total number of adults with a hearing impairment in care placements funded by the local authority by 

 

a)     In area, residential care

b)     Out of area, residential care 

c)     In area, supported living

d)     Out of area, supported living

e)     Home/domiciliary care 

 

Q6. Please provide the local authority’s expenditure on care placements for adults with a hearing impairment by 

 

a)     In area, residential care

b)     Out of area, residential care

c)     In area, supported living

d)     Out of area, supported living

e)     Home/domiciliary care 

f)      Total expenditure on all placements for hearing impairment 

 

Q7. Please provide the highest, lowest and average fee paid to care providers for adults with a hearing impairment by 

 

a)     Residential care (Weekly)

b)     Supported living (Hourly)

c)     Home/domiciliary care (Hourly)

 

Q8. Please list all supported living and home/domiciliary care providers currently commissioned by the local authority to provide care services for people with a hearing impairment 

Please see the attached spreadsheet in response to questions 2 through to 8.  
To clarify, In response to question 7.a) we had 1 service user with a hearing impairment in residential care in 2014/15 only. In response to 7.c) we do not record Home/Domiciliary Care homes fees hourly. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
 Where data is not recorded for hearing impairment, please give answers for sensory impairment. 

 

‘Hearing impairment’ refers to any individual with deafness, hearing loss/partial hearing and tinnitus. ‘Adults’ refers to those aged 18-65. 

 

To clarify, supported living does not include sole providers of accommodation, such as housing associations; only registered providers of social care. Domiciliary care refers to care provided to people living in their own homes by visiting staff. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

