Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. 
You asked:

1. The number of councillors currently serving (including those standing down or up for re-election on 2 May, if applicable)
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.
http://www.cabinet.leicester.gov.uk:8071/mgMemberIndex.aspx?bcr=1
2. Of those, how many are male? How many are female? 

3. How many councillors are white (including British, English, Scottish, Irish, Welsh, Gypsy or Irish Traveller or any other white background)?

4. How many councillors are mixed (including white and black Caribbean, white and black African, white and Asian or any other mixed background)?

5. How many councillors are Asian or Asian British (including Indian, Pakistani, Bangladeshi, Chinese or any other Asian background)?

6. How many councillors are Black (including African, Caribbean, Black British or any other Black background)?

7. How many councillors are from any other ethnic group not referred to above?

8. How many councillors are in each of these age ranges:

18-24

25-34

35-44

45-54

55-64

65+

The Council does not hold this information, we do not collect this data  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

