Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

I would like to request the following information regarding spending and contracts for older person’s social services (aged 65 and over)

1. Does the Local Authority operate a usual cost of care for older person’s social services? By usual cost of care, we mean set weekly fee rates that the Local Authority pays to care providers for older people’s residential, residential EMI, nursing, and nursing EMI care. 
Yes, however we refer to dependent older people and highly dependent people/physical disability not EMI

2. If the answer to question 1 is ‘yes’, does the Local Authority have a banding system for fee rates? By ‘banding system’ we mean different levels of fees according to a council’s own criteria i.e. quality grades. 
Yes, however the banding system refers to the needs of the service user rather than a quality criteria

3. If the answer to question 2 is ‘no’, please provide the Local Authority’s own set weekly fee rates for 2018/19 and 2019/20 for: 

a.  Older person’s residential 

b. Older person’s residential EMI 

c. Older person’s nursing 

d. Older person’s nursing EMI 
Not applicable.
4. If the answer to question 2 is ‘yes’, please provide the Local Authority’s own weekly set fees associated with each band/grade for 2018/19 and 2019/2020 for:
a.  Older person’s residential 
	Dependent Older People 
	£483 
	£508 


	Highly Dependent People/Physical Disability 
	£543 
	£572 


b. Older person’s residential EMI
EMI is not recorded on our system. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
c. Older person’s nursing 
	Nursing Band – Accommodation & Personal Elements 
	£513 
	£540 


d. Older person’s nursing EMI 
EMI is not recorded on our system. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council
5. Please provide the highest, lowest, average (mean) and median actual weekly fees paid to older person’s care providers in 2018/19 and 2019/20
a.  Older person’s residential 
	OP (Residential)
	2018/19
	2019/20 (to date)

	Highest = 
	£1,620
	£1,556

	Lowest = 
	£483
	£508

	Mean (average) = 
	£501
	£557

	Median = 
	£483
	£572


Values recorded for 2019/20 are based on a ‘snapshot’ of older persons (aged 65+) care packages as at mid-April 2019. The lowest and median values should not change (as these are the banded rates and will not change throughout 2019/20, with most placements being at banded rate. The median and highest values may be subject to change where future packages include additional personal care.

b. Older person’s residential EMI 
EMI is not recorded on our system. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
c. Older person’s nursing
Note: figures quoted are exclusive of FNC payments.

	                OP (Nursing)
	2018/19
	2019/20 (to date)

	Highest = 
	£1,551
	£1,578

	Lowest = 
	£513
	£540

	Mean (average) = 
	£554
	£565

	Median = 
	£513
	£540


Values recorded for 2019/20 are based on a ‘snapshot’ of nursing care packages as at mid-April 2019. The lowest and median values should not change (as these are the banded rates and will not change throughout 2019/20, with most placements being at banded rate. The median and highest values may be subject to change where future packages include additional personal care.

d. Older person’s nursing EMI
EMI is not recorded on our system. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
For clarification, EMI stands for Elderly Mentally Infirm 

If figures for 2019/20 are not available please provide budgeted or predicted figures
The years 2018/19 and 2019/20 refer to their relevant financial years

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

