Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Supported Living
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Is there a framework in place for the provision of Supported Living for adults with:
· Learning Disabilities / Autism, 
Answer:

Yes

· Mental Health, 
Yes

· Complex Needs, 
Part of other lots (Learning Disabilities, Mental Health and Physical Disability/ Sensory Impairment)

· Forensic / Risk of Offending, etc? 
No

2. If so, can I have a list of all providers who are on this framework?

Accredo Support and Development Ltd

Advance Housing and Support Limited

Affinity Trust

Aspirations Care Limited

Bonney Care Agency Ltd

CareTech Community Services Ltd

Community Integrated Care

Creative Support

Evolving Care Limited

Lifeways

MacIntyre

Making Space

Pathfinders Community Support Ltd

Royal Mencap Society

Thera South Midlands

3. When do the contracts run out for these providers?
21 November 2020

4. When is the next tender process for Supported Living or equivalent going to begin?
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. Which individual is responsible for sourcing properties for Supported Living;

Head of Commissioning - Kate Galoppi

6. Which department/ board/ group are they apart of; 

Social Care and Commissioning 
7. What are their contact details? (email and direct phone number)

Email: Kate.Galoppi@leicester.gov.uk
Telephone No. 0116 454 2373

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


