Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:

Please note for ‘jurisdiction’ we have used the definition as ‘area’ of Leicester and not to act with ‘authority’ in concern to the Provider allocating beds.  We contract with a number of Providers and have ‘referral rights’ to any vacant beds the Provider may have.  Those residing with the Provider may come via Leicester City Council, another Authority or a self-funder.

The only area where we can act with ‘authority’ is for Short-term beds, as a number of beds have been block purchased with two Providers and allows us to place a service user in one of the purchased 6 Reablement beds at any one time.    

Care capacity 
· In 2018, the number of full-time care home beds under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council. And the breakdown of bed numbers managed by 

· a) the local authority: 0
b) the third sector: 0 

c) the private sector: 2657

· In 2018, the number of occupied full-time care home beds under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council. And the breakdown of bed numbers managed by 

a) the local authority: 0

b) the third sector: 0 
c) the private sector: 2421 

· In 2018, the number of unoccupied full-time care home beds under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council. And the breakdown of bed numbers managed by 

a) the local authority: 0

b) the third sector: 0 
c) the private sector: 236 
· Throughout 2018, the average available care home capacity as a percentage of total care home capacity under the jurisdiction of the local authority: 8.88% 

· The number of care providers, that have provided care on behalf and under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council that have face insolvency since 2010: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Care funding
· In 2018, the number of care home occupants, under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council, who 

a) Have their needs fully-funded by Leicester City Council: 1744

b) Have their needs fully-funded by the NHS: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
C) Have their needs partly funded by Leicester City Council: 107 
d) Self-fund their own care in full: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council
· In 2018, the number of those receiving full-time home care, under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council, who a) Have their needs fully-funded by Leicester City Council b) Have their needs fully-funded by the NHS C) Have their needs partly funded by Leicester City Council d) Self-fund their own care in full: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council
· In 2018, the number of those over the age of 65 assessed as having a care need, under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council, who 

· a) Have their needs fully-funded by  Borough Council: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council
· b) Have their needs fully-funded by the NHS: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council
· C) Have their needs partly funded by  Borough Council: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
· d) Self-fund their own care in full: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
In 2018, the average weekly cost of care home beds, under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council, who a) Have their needs fully-funded by Leicester City Council b) Have their needs fully-funded by the NHS C) Have their needs partly funded by Leicester City Council d) Self-fund their own care in full. We do not split our service user data in the categories asked. We use standard weekly banded rates to pay for care home beds. If the individual service user needs exceed the standard weekly banded rate then additional payments, over & above, are made and are known as ‘additional payments’ 

· The average sum Leicester City Council contributes to those over the age of 65, assessed as having a care need, who are part-funding their care. £315.09 weekly average contribution

· The highest sum Leicester City Council contributes to those over the age of 65, assessed as having a care need, who are part-funding their care. £3,024.30 highest weekly contribution


Leicester City Council budget (per capita)
· In 2018, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The Leicester City Council budget for adult social care c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that is spent on those over the age of 65. 
· In 2017, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The Leicester City Council budget for adult social care c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that was spent on those over the age of 65. 

· In 2016, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The Leicester City Council budget for adult social care c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that was spent on those over the age of 65. 

· In 2015, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The Leicester City Council budget for adult social care c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that was spent on those over the age of 65. 
· In 2014, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The Leicester City Council budget for adult social care c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that is spent on those over the age of 65. 

· In 2013, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The  Borough Council budget for adult social care The Council does not hold Borough Council budget information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council
· c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that is spent on those over the age of 65. 
· In 2012, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The Leicester City Council budget for adult social care c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that is spent on those over the age of 65. 

· In 2011, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The Leicester City Council budget for adult social care c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that is spent on those over the age of 65. 
· In 2010, the monetary sum of a) The overall Leicester City Council budget b) The Leicester City Council budget for adult social care c) The Leicester City Council adult social care budget that is spent on those over the age of 65. 
In response to the above questions regarding the Council’s budget. 

	
	Net expenditure budget (before transfers to/from reserves) £m
	Adult Social Care budget ceilings (excluding Public Health) £m

	18/19
	269.9
	105.1

	17/18
	275.9
	105.6

	16/17
	285.1
	103.2

	15/16
	267.9
	88.5

	14/15
	271.8
	90.2

	13/14
	296.2
	88.7

	12/13
	288.4
	86.6

	11/12
	296.7
	83.7

	10/11
	278.7
	77.1


The years are not comparable, due to funding changes (e.g. grants moving into mainstream funding) and changes to the way we show budgets locally (e.g. centralising/decentralising various costs). 
There is not a separate budget for those over the age of 65, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council
· In 2018, the total number of those over the age of 65, assessed as having a care need and entitled to funding from Leicester City Council, who had financial support in the form of a direct payment. 830 service users

· In 2018, the total number of those over the age of 65, assessed as having a care need and entitled to funding from Leicester City Council, who received financial support from the Leicester City Council. 3818 service users

Workforce
· The average vacancy rate for adult social care jobs under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council throughout 2018. The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
· The average vacancy rate for care home jobs under the jurisdiction of Leicester City Council throughout 2018: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
· Care staff turnover as a percentage of total care staff workforce under the jurisdiction of the local authority in 2018 The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
· The number of care workers, under the jurisdiction of the local authority, who are paid less than the National Living Wage.  All contracts signed with Private sector Providers requires them to pay the National Living wage for employees.

Elderly population 
· The number of elderly people over the age of 65 in 

a) 2018, b) 2017, c) 2016, d) 2015, e) 2014
2014 – 39,465

2015 – 40,054

2016 – 40,725

2017 – 41,536

2018 – Data are not available until June 2019. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Source: ONS Mid-Year population estimates for the years shown 

No of elderly people, aged 65+, receiving long term support in the financial year:

2014/15 – 3,964

2015/16 – 3,908

2016/17 – 3,845

2017/18 – 3,770

2018/19 – 3,691 (provisional data)

Source: SALT

· The number of elderly people over the age of 65 who were assessed as having a care need in 

a) 2018, b) 2017, c) 2016, d) 2015, e) 2014.
· 2014/15 – 2,812

· 2015/16 – 2,986

· 2016/17 – 2,842

· 2017/18 – 1,472

· 2018/19 – 1,073 (provisional data)

· The number of elderly people over the age of 65 who were assessed as having a full-time care need in a) 2018 b) 2017 c) 2016 d) 2015 e) 2014: The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council
Safeguarding 
· For those adults over the age of 65 receiving social care under the jurisdiction of the local authority, the number of reported ‘safeguarding’ escalations to the local authority during 2018. The number of safeguarding enquiries started during 2018/19 was 214 (provisional data)

· For those adults over the age of 65 receiving social care under the jurisdiction of the local authority, the number of reported abuse allegations to the local authority during 2018.  The number of Safeguarding Adults Alerts received during 2018/19 was 912 (provisional data)

· For those adults over the age of 65 receiving social care under the jurisdiction of the local authority, the number of sanctioned abuse allegations to the local authority during 2018.  
The number of sanctioned abuse allegations to the local authority during 2018 is not recorded. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
We do record the number of Safeguarding Enquiries concluded during the year, and the outcome of each, where a risk was identified during the enquiry. 

In 2018/19 our provisional data show that:

205 Enquiries concluded in the period where a risk was identified, and of these the risk outcomes were as shown:

	Risk reduced
	114

	Risk remains
	18

	Risk removed
	73


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

