Freedom of Information Act 2000 – placement of looked after children
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. How many children were looked after by your local authority in the following periods of time
a)  Between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
Answer:

877

b) between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
883

c) between 1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
863

d) between 1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016

783

2. How many children were looked after by your local authority in the following periods of time
a) at 31 March 2019
666

b) at 31 March 2018
676

c) at 31 March 2017
639

d) at 31 March 2016

596

3. How many looked after children at 31 March of each year specified below were placed in the following settings outside your local authority boundaries? 

	Code 
	Explanation 
	31 March 2019 
	31 March 2018
	31 March 2017
	31 March 2016

	H5
	Semi-independent living accommodation not subject to Children’s Homes Regulations 
	4
	1
	4
	2

	K1
	Secure Children’s Homes 
	1
	3
	2
	1

	K2
	Children’s Homes subject to Children’s Homes Regulations 
	31
	35
	34
	31

	R1
	Residential Care Home 
	1
	1
	1
	

	R2
	National Health Service/Health Trust or other establishment providing medical or nursing care 
	1
	
	
	2

	R3
	Family Centre or Mother and Baby Unit 
	1
	6
	
	1

	R5
	Young Offender Institution (YOI) or Secure Training Centre (STC) 
	2
	3
	4
	3

	U1
	Foster placement with relative(s) or friend(s) – long term fostering 
	47
	43
	37
	22

	U2
	Fostering placement with relative(s) or friend(s) who is/are also an approved adopter(s) – FFA/concurrent planning 
	
	
	
	

	U3
	Fostering placement with relative(s) or friend(s) who is/are not long-term or FFA/concurrent planning 
	
	
	
	2

	U4


	Foster placement with other foster carer(s) – long term fostering 
	21
	26
	24
	23

	U5
	Foster placement with other foster carer(s) who is/are also an approved adopter(s) – FFA/concurrent planning 
	
	
	
	

	U6
	Foster placement with other foster carer(s) – not long term or FFA/concurrent planning 
	166
	137
	79
	57


4. How many looked after children at 31 March of each year specified below were placed in the following settings inside your local authority boundaries? 

	Code 
	Explanation 
	31 March 2019 
	31 March 2018
	31 March 2017
	31 March 2018

	H5
	Semi-independent living accommodation not subject to Children’s Homes Regulations

	9
	20
	32
	27

	K1
	Secure Children’s Homes
	
	
	
	

	K2
	Children’s Homes subject to Children’s Homes Regulations 
	23
	23
	23
	23

	R1
	Residential Care Home 
	
	
	
	

	R2
	National Health Service/Health Trust or other establishment providing medical or nursing care 
	
	
	
	

	R3
	Family Centre or Mother and Baby Unit 
	
	
	
	

	R5
	Young Offender Institution (YOI) or Secure Training Centre (STC) 
	
	
	
	

	U1
	Foster placement with relative(s) or friend(s) – long term fostering 
	59
	45
	48
	34

	U2
	Fostering placement with relative(s) or friend(s) who is/are also an approved adopter(s) – FFA/concurrent planning 
	
	
	
	

	U3
	Fostering placement with relative(s) or friend(s) who is/are not long-term or FFA/concurrent planning 
	7
	9
	10
	10

	U4


	Foster placement with other foster carer(s) – long term fostering 
	22
	18
	13
	13

	U5
	Foster placement with other foster carer(s) who is/are also an approved adopter(s) – FFA/concurrent planning 
	
	
	
	

	U6
	Foster placement with other foster carer(s) – not long term or FFA/concurrent planning 
	96
	96
	37
	31


5. In the periods of time specified in the table below how many looked after children, who your local authority was responsible for, were placed outside of your local authority boundaries and how many placements did this relate to?  

	
	How many children 
	How many placements 

	a) Between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	512
	614

	b) between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
	515
	648

	c) between 1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	491
	625

	d) between 1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	457
	578


6. In the periods of time specified in the table below how many children were placed in out of area placements more than 20 miles of their home address and how many placements this relates to? 

	
	How many children


	How many placements 

	a) Between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	181
	217

	b) between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
	199
	244

	c) between 1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	181
	238

	d) between 1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	159
	196


Note: figures given are for placements that are non Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland postcodes. We are unable to calculate distance as the home address is not recorded on our system.  
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
7. Of the children placed outside your local authority boundaries and in the periods of time specified in the table below how many looked after children were placed in distant placements and how many placements this relates to?
	
	How many children 
	How many placements 

	Between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	183
	219

	b) between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
	201
	246

	c) between 1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	181
	238

	d) between 1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	159
	196


Looked after children your local authority is responsible for going missing from our of area placements 

8. Of the children placed outside your local authority boundaries and in the periods of time specified in the table below how many children went missing and how many missing incidents it relates to?

	
	How many individual children were reported missing and absent during the same time period? 
	How many incidents did this correspond to?

	Between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	41
	278

	b) between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
	51
	394

	c) between 1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	41
	314

	d) between 1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	
	


The Council does not hold accurate figures for the 2015-16 as it started recording this information half way through the year.  Therefore this is a refusal notice in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information is not held by the Council.

9. Who is currently commissioned to provide RHIs to looked after children who are placed out of area?
	
	Yes
	No

	a) Local authority staff from your local authority 
	Yes
	

	b) Local authority staff from the area that the child is placed
	Yes
	

	c) External independent provider
	Yes
	

	d) A mixture of different providers
	Yes
	

	e) None
	
	


10. For the looked after children your local authority is responsible for placed outside of your local authority and for the periods of time specified in the table below how many children went missing from the following placements: 

	
	Unique reference numbers relating to settings that are subject to Ofsted inspections?


	Unique reference numbers relating to settings that are inspected by the Care Quality Commission or Independent Inspectorate?
	Not subject to inspection?
	Foster care placements 

	1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	
	
	
	

	1 April 2017and 31 March 2018
	
	
	
	

	1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	
	
	
	

	1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	
	
	
	


11. For the looked after children your local authority is responsible for placed outside of your local authority and for the periods of time specified in the table below how missing incidents were reported from the following placements: 

	
	Unique reference numbers relating to settings that are subject to Ofsted inspections?


	Unique reference numbers relating to settings that are inspected by the Care Quality Commission or Independent Inspectorate?
	Not subject to inspection?
	Foster care placements 

	1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	
	
	
	

	1 April 2017and 31 March 2018
	
	
	
	

	1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	
	
	
	

	1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	
	
	
	


Looked after children from other local authorities placed in your local area

12. In the periods of time specified in the table below how many looked after children were placed in your local authority by other local authorities and how many placements this relates to?
	
	How many children 
	How many placements 

	a) between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	
	

	b) between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
	
	

	c) between 1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	
	

	d) between 1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	
	


13. Out of children placed in your local authority by other local authorities and in the period of time specified in the table below how many children were in distant placements?

	
	How many children 
	How many placements 

	Between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	
	

	b) between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
	
	

	c) between 1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	
	

	d) between 1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	
	


In respect of Qs 10-13, the Council does not record this information in a reportable format.  
To collate this information would require a manual trawl of every record for the period in question.  This exercise would exceed the cost limit prescribed in the Freedom of Information Act.
We would need to look into every placement of each child and align this to their missing record to extract the information. This is 1,225 placements and 877 young people for 2018-19 alone. At a minimum of 5 minutes per person, this is nearly 585 hours. It is 2,042 placements for 1,484 children and young people across the whole time period.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, along with locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The Council has duly determined that to undertake such an exercise would exceed the limit specified above.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

14. Out of children placed in your local authority by other local authorities and in the period of time specified in the table below how many children went missing and how many missing incidents it relates to?
	
	How many individual children were reported missing and absent during the same time period? 


	How many incidents did this correspond to?

	Between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
	0
	0

	b) between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
	0
	0

	c) between 1 April 2016 and 31 March 2017
	4
	4

	d) between 1 April 2015 and 31 March 2016
	3
	6


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


