[image: image1.jpg]Leicester
City Council




Email:

      info.requests@leicester.gov.uk

Website:
www.leicester.gov.uk 






Our ref:               
FOIA 18158
Date:
13th May 2019
Ms Zoe Brennan

zedbee75@googlemail.com
Dear Ms Brennan
Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:

Freedom of Information Act 200 request re Transit Sites

Q1. Does your Local Authority have a transit site intended to be used by the Traveller and Gypsy Community?
No.

If No, are you considering the development of a transit site?
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

If Yes: Not applicable.

Q2. How many caravans does the site/s accommodate?

Q3. How many days has the site been occupied since 1 January 2018. 

Q4. What is the average number of occupation (caravans) on each occasion?

Q5. What facilities are available on-site e.g toilets, washing lines, play areas?

Q6. Is the transit site free to use? If Yes go to Q8

Q7. If there is a charge please explain the tariff eg, deposit and or daily / weekly charge?

Q8. Who manages the running of the site?

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Yours sincerely

Pravina Chandarana
Information Governance and Risk
Tell us how we’re doing: We would be very grateful if you could answer a few short questions in this anonymous online survey about our response to you so that we can continue to improve our services.
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