Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:
Portfolio Holder for Transport
Head of Transport Committee
Leicester City Council
01 May 2019
RE: Freedom of Information Request for Leicester City Council Bus Safety Incident Data for 
Q1 (1 January – 30 March) 2019
Dear Sir or Madame,
Since 2014, Transport for London (TfL) has published Bus Safety Incident Data on its website 
every quarter (https://tfl.gov.uk/corporate/publications-and-reports/bus-safety-data). 
The data publishes shows injuries by Bus Route, Operator and Borough supported by a 
dataset containing all this information made available for public scrutiny.
Accordingly, I would to make a Freedom of Information Request for Leicester City Council to 
provide me with a spreadsheet displaying the Bus Safety Incident Data for the period 1 
January -30 March 2019 showing:
1. Date of Incident
2. Bus Route
3. Local Name of Operator
4. Operator Group Name (if applicable)
5. Bus Garage/Depot 
6. Injury Description (Fatality, Serious/Minor Injury – Taken to Hospital, Minor? Treated at Scene)
7. Victim's Sex
8. Victim's Age
9. Incident Event Type (Collision, Fall, Assault, other)
10. Victim Category (Passenger, Pedestrian, Cyclists, 3rd Party Vehicle, Bus Driver, other
Answer: The Council does not hold this information. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may wish to approach the bus companies directly.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

