Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:

Please supply the following information about your Occupational Therapy Assessments:

1. Of adults receiving long term care and support, how many planned reviews have been completed in the last 12 months by the Council?
In response to questions 1 – 3.

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This information is not recorded in a reportable format; it is not captured as part of our performance data.  Therefore, the requested information would be recorded on individual case files and would require the manual trawl of each user record.  

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

Adults OT: Due to the way in which our current case recording system is configurated we are unable to confirm how many planned reviews took place over the last 12 months which included Occupational Therapy intervention.  It is important to note that planned reviews are completed by our Care Management (Social Work Teams) and where it is perceived that Occupational Therapy intervention is required, an OT referral is sent through. However, we are unable to generate a report which confirms whether those Service Users referred to the OT Service are in receipt of long term care and support.

Enablement OT: Planned reviews are completed by Care Management at this time. OT intervention takes place at the point of referral to Enablement and assessments are completed to establish Enablement (or a strand of Enablement) eligibility and / or Eligibility for ASC. Whilst recommendations may be made to Care management as the short term Enablement intervention ends, we are not able to generate a report which confirms whether those Service Users referred to the Enablement OT Service are subsequently in receipt of long term care and support.

2. Of adults receiving long term care and support, what percentage received a planned review within the timescales set out and agreed by the Council?
Adults OT: Due to the way in which our current case recording system is configurated we are unable to confirm what percentage of Service Users received a planned review in terms of long-term support within agreed timescales.  
Enablement OT: Due to the way in which our current case recording system is configurated we are unable to confirm what percentage of Service Users received a planned review in terms of long term support within agreed timescales.

3. Of adults in receipt of equipment and / or adaptations, how many of these received a planned review?
Adults OT: Due to the way in which our current case recording system is configurated we are unable to confirm how many Service Users received a planned reviewed in addition to being in receipt of equipment and or adaptations.  However, after Occupational Therapy interventions are completed, if it is felt that the provision of care and support needs to be reviewed, the allocated Occupational Therapy Worker will refer to Social Work colleagues. At times this may form part of planned reviews, however this could also result in an unplanned review too.
Enablement OT: OT interventions however (including assistive technology provided) are reviewed prior to the short term support / case being closed to our Service area and an overview of work completed is provided to care management via a telephone conversation, the case transfer / closure summary and the final feedback visit undertaken by Enablement care management Officers. Any subsequent planned review would be undertaken by care management colleagues.

4. What percentage of planned reviews are done face to face?
Adults OT: As Occupational Therapy staff do not complete planned reviews for the provision of care and support we are unable to provide this information.  In terms of reviewing the Occupational Therapy intervention itself 65% of the interventions (equipment/ minor and major adaptations) are reviewed face to face. 

Enablement OT: As Enablement Occupational Therapy staff do not complete planned reviews for the provision of care and support we are unable to provide this information.

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. What percentage of planned reviews are done over the telephone or via another method?
Adults OT: As Occupational Therapy staff do not complete planned reviews for the provision of care and support we are unable to provide this information.  In terms of reviewing the Occupational Therapy intervention itself 15% of the interventions (equipment/ minor and major adaptations) are reviewed face to face. Another 20% of reviews are not completed, based on clinical judgement where it is felt that the presenting needs are not complex, Service Users are asked to contact the OT Service if needed.  

Enablement OT: As Occupational Therapy staff do not complete planned reviews for the provision of care and support we are unable to provide this information. However, all of our short term Enablement Occupational Therapy intervention is initiated by a telephone call / letter and then undertaken during face to face visits.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6. What is the average waiting time for Service Users of Adult Social Care from request for Occupational Therapy Assessment to the assessment being carried out?
Adults OT: Occupational Therapy assessment requests can be received any time during the week, once received the request is screened to confirm its suitability. Requests are prioritised in terms of risk and whether the assessment (face to face) needs to be completed by an Occupational Therapist or a Care Management Officer (Occupational Therapist Assistant). Allocation for assessments are completed every Friday. Therefore, depending on when the request is received there could be a 5/7 day waiting period. 

Enablement OT: OT referrals can be received at any point during the week, and the referral is currently screened and processed by Enablement managers to the OT tray. Once received, the OT aims to initiate the assessment as soon as is possible, but within two weeks.   

7. What is the longest waiting time for Service Users of Adult Social Care from request for Occupational Therapy Assessment to the assessment being carried out?
Adults OT: 10 working days

Enablement OT: 10 working days (however there are occasional exceptions if several cases arrive in succession. 
8. Do you use any third parties to deliver Occupational Therapy assessments (e.g. locums, private sector organisations or self-employed Occupational Therapists)?
Adults OT: We do not use any third parties to complete assessments on our behalf. 
Enablement OT: We do not use any third parties to complete assessments on our behalf.

9. If so, please give the name of the organisation(s) and the number of assessments completed by each during the period 1.1.2018 to 1.1.2019?
Not applicable.

10. Do you have an official contract with any of the above organisations and if so, when is this due to end?
Not applicable.
11. Can you please provide contact details for the current Head of Adult Services and Review/Reassessment Team Manager?
Adults OT: Jagjit Singh Bains, Head of Service for Independent Living, 0116 4545422

Enablement OT: Mary McCausland, Head of Service for Enablement, 0116 4545421

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

