Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.
You asked:

1. How many schools is your council responsible for?
Secondary schools: 19 Secondary Schools: 9 Maintained, 10 Academy.
Primary schools: 82 Primary Schools: 52 Maintained, 30 Academy.
 
2. Has the council identified ‘period poverty’ as a priority?
At this time Leicester City Council has not commissioned services in relation to period poverty.  However, the 2019-2023 Labour Manifesto contains a pledge to ‘Provide free sanitary products in city council public buildings’
 
3. How many schools provide or are due to provide paid-for sanitary provisions (e.g. sanitary towels, tampons) for pupils?
· Number of secondary schools:
· Name of secondary schools:
· Number of primary schools:
· Number of primary schools:
 
4. How many schools provide or are due to provide free sanitary products (e.g. sanitary towels, tampons) for pupils? 
· Number of secondary schools:
· Name of secondary schools and format free sanitary products are provided e.g. basket in toilet, basket behind reception/school nurse, vending machine, on request to teacher:
· Number of primary schools:
· Number of primary schools and format free sanitary products are provided e.g. basket in toilet, basket behind reception/school nurse, on request to teacher:
The Council does not hold this information; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held. 
Schools are responsible for their own budgets and are responsible for determining what actions are necessary to fulfil the needs of their pupils.
Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to a list of schools within the Authority: 

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council-services/education-lifelong-learning/about-schools/schools-directory/schools-directory/ School ward, head teacher, telephone, e mail etc. is available by clicking on the link for each school. 

 
5. Does your council have funding allocated for period poverty and/or providing free sanitary products within schools?
· Yes / No
If Yes:
· Amount:
· Over what time period: 
· Source:
· What has this money been used for / been allocated for? 
No, not at this time.

 
6. Have you already invested or do you have plans to invest in any period poverty/free sanitary product measures? If so, please detail and include whether this has been completed or is planned for the future. 
No, not at this time.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

