Freedom of Information Act 2000 – mental health provision for children and young people
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1)      What specific provision is available in your area for children and young people diagnosed with conduct disorder and those with conduct difficulties? Please list individual services and tiers they fall under (e.g. Tier 2 or targeted; Tier 3 or community specialist or Tier 4 or inpatient).

Answer:

The Local Authority does not hold this information. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
Diagnosed Mental Health conditions are treated by Leicestershire Partnership Trust, (LPT).  Please direct this question to LPT at:

  
https://www.leicspart.nhs.uk/_Aboutus-FreedomofInformation.aspx
2)      What mental health provision is available in your area for children and young people in contact with social services, including looked after children, children in need or children under child protection orders? Please list individual services and corresponding tiers as above.
The service provision responsibility for Children in Need (CIN)/LAC (Looked After Children) and Child Protection (CP) cases in relation to Mental Health is a Leicester Partnership Trust area of responsibility for complex mental health. 
The Local Authority have specific funded projects working with LAC/CIN/ and CP children’s mental health, i.e. The Emotional Wellbeing in Education Project which specifically work with LAC children.  
I understand that there is some specific health funding from health professionals to work with LAC children, i.e. a LAC Nurse.  At a universal level, all children can access school nurses.  
The City Early Intervention Psychology Service (CEIPS), funded by the Clinical Commissioning Group also works with certain CIN/LAC and children subject to Child Protection Orders children with Mental Health Issues.  
The Social Emotional and Mental Health (SEMH) team based in Special Educational Needs and Disability (SEND) provide support to Primary Schools in relation to behaviour and mental health.
A number of children known to the SEMH team are LAC/CIN and subject to Child Protection Orders. 

3)      Is there specific provision in your area to support young people transitioning from child and adolescent mental health services to adult mental health services? Yes or no answer please. Please specify if CAMHS in your area covers individuals aged 18 and over and please specify the age range covered.
As in Qs 1 above, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  Please direct this question to Child and Adolescent Mental Health Service (CAMHS), Leicestershire Partnership Trust who provide mental health services.

4)      Do you engage with any of the following to understand the mental health needs of children and young people in your area?

a) Healthwatch

No
b) Children and young people and their families 
Yes

c) Community and/or faith groups 
No
d) Charities or other NGOs (if yes, please specify which ones) 
Yes, Stonewall for LGBT links to mental Health.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


