Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Homeless Reconnections 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
Please could I request the following information about the “reconnection” of homeless people to other areas of the UK or overseas.

Q1. 
How many homeless people were given transport to leave your area in each of the following financial years?

a) Apr 5th 2014-Apr 4th 2015
Answer:
108

b) Apr 5th 2015-Apr 4th 2016
112

c) Apr 5th 2016-Apr 4th 2017
100

d) Apr 5th 2017-Apr 4th 2018
98

e) Apr 5th 2018-Apr 4th 2019
70

Q2.
Please give a breakdown of where people were returned to (over the five year period, above)

UK – 377

EU – 108

Non EU – 3

Q3.
How many of the above were one-way train tickets?

Information is not collected to distinguish between trains or coaches, only flights.

This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.
Q4. 
How many of the above were one-way flights?

91
Q5.
Please give a male/female breakdown of the above.

Gender information is not recorded by the Council, therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.

Only names are recorded by the Council and this cannot determine a person’s gender.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


