Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Elderly Care
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Who within the Local Authority, has the commissioning responsibility for adults aged 65+? Please provide their:
 a.     Name

 b.     Job title

 c.     Telephone number

 d.     Email address

 

2. Please provide the gross total expenditure on older person’s (age 65+) services, as follows, for financial years 2016/17 to 2019/20. Please provide budgeted spend where actual figures are not available:

a.     Gross total expenditure on older person's (65+) services
b.     Gross total expenditure on residential home placements (65+)
c.     Gross total expenditure on nursing home placements (65+)
d.     Gross total expenditure on domiciliary care/home care (65+)
 

3. Please provide figures for the total number of older people (age 65+) that the council has placed and funded in:

 a.     Residential care

 b.     Residential EMI care

 c.     Nursing care

 d.     Nursing EMI care

 e.     Domiciliary care/home care

Please supply this information by financial year for 2016/17 to 2019/2020. Please provide projected figures where actual figures are not available.

 

4. Please provide figures for the numbers of older people (age 65+) that are privately funded in: 

Note: By privately funded we mean the service user or service user’s family are self-funding the care with no local authority contribution. 
 a.     Residential care

 b.     Residential EMI care

 c.     Nursing care

 d.     Nursing EMI care

Please supply this information by financial year for 2016/17 to 2019/2020. Please provide projected figures where actual figures are not available.

Answer:
Please find relevant information in the attached spreadsheet.
Please note that the Council does not hold information for Qs 3b, d and Q4.  

Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


