Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:
1. On average, how many days does it take for you to turnaround a void property?
Answer: For 2018-19, we computed the average turnaround timescale at 85.8 days.  This figure includes several long-term voids, which needed more specialist work, and this would have contributed to the timescales. Examples of the types of work include damp proofing work, woodworm and timber treatment, asbestos removal and structural repairs, amongst several other categories.
2. What percentage of repairs and maintenance jobs do you complete within the first appointment?
For 2018-19, the final calculation came out at 89.4%. There are some repairs which by their nature can never be completed on a first appointment. If we take glazing repairs, for example, one appointment is required to measure the window, the glass then needs to be cut to size and fitted during a follow-on appointment.
3. As of 1st June 2019, how many Fire Risk Assessments are overdue?
0. All our properties needing a fire assessment do have one, and these are reviewed every year to make sure they’re still up-to-date.
4. In relation to your property repairs and maintenance, what is your tenant satisfaction percentage?
The closest information we hold is around the percentage of repairs which lead to a complaint. For 2018-19 this was calculated at 0.21% (approximately 1 complaint from every 500 repairs).
5. On average, how many repairs and maintenance jobs does each of your operatives complete per day? 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

