Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (‘the Act’) to please request the following information in relation to farm animal species only during the year of 2018:

1. How many welfare complaints did you receive in relation to the following:

a. On-farm animal welfare; 

         Answer: 1 
b. Welfare at markets; and,
0 

c. Welfare during transport?
1

2. How many welfare complaints did you investigate in relation to the following:

a. On-farm animal welfare;
1

b. Welfare at markets; and,
0

c. Welfare during transport?
1

3. How many prosecution proceedings did you commence for offences named in the Animal Welfare Act 2006?
0

a. Of those proceedings, how many resulted in a successful prosecution?
N/A

4. How many improvement notices did you serve under section 10 of the Animal Welfare Act 2006 for failures to comply with section 9(1) of that Act?
0

5. How many prosecution proceedings did you commence for offences named in Section 7 of the Welfare of Farmed Animals (England) Regulations 2007?
0
a. Of those proceedings, how many resulted in a successful prosecution?
N/A

6. How many compliance notices were issued by your inspectors for failures to comply with the Welfare of Animals (Transport) (England) Order 2006?
0

7. How many prosecution proceedings did you commence for offences named in the Welfare of Animals at Markets Order 1990?
0

a. Of those proceedings, how many resulted in a successful prosecution?
N/A

8. How many individuals subject to any of the above enforcement action had previously committed an animal welfare offence?
0

9. How many people do you employ to carry out farm animal welfare inspections as part of their duties?
1

a. How many farm animal welfare inspections did they complete?
1

10. How many people do you employ to carry out enforcement of the Animal Health Act 1981 as part of their duties?
1

11. Please may you also send me a Schedule of Documents (aka a List of Information) held relating to farm animal welfare law enforcement activity in 2018. I would like to receive this in Excel format.
No statutory notices were issued, and no issues were raise relating to Welfare enforcement. The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

