Freedom of Information Act 2000 – contraceptive services 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
 
Request 1:
· Please state (a) the total public health budget allocated (including for GP and pharmacist services) by your local authority for all sexual and reproductive health services, (b) budget allocated to general practice for all sexual and reproductive health services, (c) budget allocated to specialist community sexual and reproductive health service providers (including integrated sexual health providers) for all sexual and reproductive health services, and (d) budget allocated out of area for all sexual and reproductive health services in:

· (i) the financial year 2015/16

· (ii) the financial year 2016/17

· (iii) the financial year 2017/18

· (iv) the financial year 2018/19; and

· (v) plans for the financial year 2019/20 (please give combined budget if within a block contract)

Answer:

	
	(a) Sexual health services
	(b) Budget allocated to sexual health services provided by GPs 
	 (c) Budget allocated to specialist sexual health services 
	(d) Out of area budget for sexual health services

	2015/16
	 £4,391k
	£222,200
	 £3,129,900
	£70,000

	2016/17
	 £4,391k
	£323,000
	 £3,633,600
	£80,000

	2017/18
	 £4,146k
	£323,000
	 £3,388,600 
	£60,000

	2018/19 
	 £4,146k
	£323,000
	 £3,388,600
	£60,000

	2019/20
	 £3,591k
	£323,000
	 £2,833,600
	£60,000


Request 2:
· Please provide the number of sites commissioned by your local authority, or a provider subcontracted by your local authority, to deliver contraceptive services in (a) the financial year 2015/16, (b) the financial year 2016/17, (c) the financial year 2017/18, (d) the financial year 2018/19 and (e) plans for the financial year 2019/20.

· If your organisation has taken a decision to reduce the number of sites, please (i) provide the reason why this decision was taken, (ii) confirm or deny whether an impact assessment was undertaken and (iii) if confirm, share the impact assessment

 
	Year
	Number of sites for contraceptive services

	2015/16
	17

	2016/17
	17

	2017/18
	17

	2018/19
	17

	2019/20
	17


Request 3:
· Please provide the total volume of activity that your organisation has contracted for the fitting and removal of LARC methods of contraception (excluding injection) in your area in (a) sexual and reproductive health services (excluding general practice) and (b) GP practices in:

· (i) the financial year 2015/16

· (ii) the financial year 2016/17

· (iii) the financial year 2017/18

· (iv) the financial year 2018/19

· (v) plans for the financial year 2019/20

All these services are open access and hence there is no contracted activity.   

This letter therefore, acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Request 4:
· Please confirm or deny whether the local authority stipulates and/or monitors waiting time requirements in contracts with (a) general practice and (b) sexual and reproductive health services for (i) sexual health appointments, (ii) contraception appointments and (iii) appointments for fitting LARC.

· If confirm, for each please release corresponding data on a) average waiting times and b) the longest waiting time in the most recent year for which figures are available

(a) General practice – No, we do not monitor waiting times for any general practice services 

(b) Sexual and Reproductive Health appointments – Yes, we monitor waiting times – 48hr access target 

· 48 hr access target 98-100% within 48 hrs
· Contraceptive appointments 

· LARC (Long-Acting Reversible Contraceptive) fitting emergency minimum, 
4-6 weeks maximum 
We don’t have any more detailed information than this, and the Council is advising you as required by Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.
Request 5:
· Please provide information on (a) the number of contracts to deliver sexual and reproductive health services, including the delivery of contraceptive services, that have been terminated earlier than planned and (b) the reasons for each withdrawal or early termination of contract in:

· (i) the financial year 2015/16
None
· (ii) the financial year 2016/17
None
· (iii) the financial year 2017/18
None
· (iv) the financial year 2018/19
None
 
Request 6:
· Please confirm or deny whether the local authority collects data on the number of complaints received relating to the provision of contraceptive services in (a) general practice and (b) community and integrated sexual health providers

· If confirm, please provide information on the number of complaints received relating to the provision of contraceptive services in (a) general practice and (b) sexual and reproductive health services in the financial years (i) 2016/17, (ii) 2017/18 and (iii) 2018/19

· If deny, please provide information on who does collect this data for your area

Yes, the authority collects data on complaints for the sexual and reproductive health services, not general practice 
	
	2016/17
	2017/18
	2018/19

	(a) General practice 
	No 
	No
	No 

	(b) Sexual and reproductive services 
	0
	2
	0


Request 7:
· Please provide information on the number of community outreach sites (targeting groups or populations who are not effectively reached by traditional health services) commissioned by the local authority to deliver (a) sexual and reproductive health services, (b) contraceptive services and (c) LARC fittings in:

· (i) the financial year 2015/16

· (ii) the financial year 2016/17

· (iii) the financial year 2017/18

· (iv) the financial year 2018/19

· (v) plans for the financial year 2019/20

We only commission integrated sexual health which includes A+B+C. 
LARC fittings are not provided in some settings if clinically inappropriate or client group not requiring this service e.g. men who have sex with men.
	
	(A) specialist sexual health services
	(B) Contraceptive services  
	LARC fittings. NB this would be included in (B)

	2015/16
	17
	
	0

	2016/17
	14
	
	0

	2017/18
	14
	
	0

	2018/19 
	14
	
	0

	2019/20
	14
	
	0


Request 8:
· Please confirm or deny whether the local authority commissions standalone sites directed towards young people aged 25 or younger providing sexual and reproductive health services, including the delivery of contraceptive services

· If confirm, please provide information on (a) any age restrictions for accessing these services, (b) the number of standalone services directed towards young people providing sexual health services and (c) the number of standalone services directed towards young people providing contraceptive services commissioned by the local authority (i) in the financial year 2017/18, (ii) in the financial year 2018/19, and (iii) plans for the financial year 2019/20
Yes, Leicester City Council commissions sexual health services specifically for young people under 25 years of age. 

Young people above this age will be seen or referred to the main service

	
	Number providing sexual health services including contraception 
	

	2017/18
	13
	

	2018/19
	12
	Reduction as site not used 

	2019/20
	11
	Change in data collection so clinics at same site different times combined 


 
Request 9:
· Please provide information on the number of conceptions resulting in live birth in (a) looked after children aged 19 or younger, (b) care leavers aged 19 or younger and (c) children who are home educated in:

· (i) the financial year 2015/16

· (ii) the financial year 2016/17

· (iii) the financial year 2017/18

· (iv) the financial year 2018/19
For the Children Looked After and Care Leavers, we can only report on those that have had appropriate relationships added to our data. 
The figures below are for children with dates of births during the period where the parent was aged under 20 at the point of birth.  Only mothers have been included. There may be cases where the mother has had children in multiple periods. 
We are withholding the actual numbers in some cases due to low levels as we believe Section 40.2 (personal data) applies.  This constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Act.  

The disclosure of this information to the wider world (which is how any disclosure made under the Act must be viewed) could identify the individual and would breach Data Protection principles. Specifically, disclosure would breach the first and second principles, those of fair, lawful and transparent processing, and those of processing for specified, legitimate and explicit purposes respectively.

	Period
	Under-19 CLA
	Under-19 CL

	2015/16
	6
	8

	2016/17
	Supressed as numbers are small 
	9

	2017/18
	Supressed as numbers are small 
	9

	2018/19
	Supressed as numbers are small 
	Supressed as numbers are small 


We don’t hold this data for Home educated children and as such we are advising       you as required by Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.  
Request 10:
· Please confirm or deny whether the local authority has a contract in place to deliver digital services for (a) sexual and reproductive health support (b) contraceptive provision and (c) sexually transmitted infection testing

· If confirm, please state who is commissioned to provide these services
· If deny, please state whether the local authority has plans to commission such services in the future

a) sexual and reproductive health support – Pilot with the main sexual health service provider Midlands Partnership Foundation Trust

(b) contraceptive provision – Pilot with the main sexual health service provider Midlands Partnership Foundation Trust

(c) sexually transmitted infection testing – Yes, the main sexual health service provider Midlands Partnership Foundation Trust
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


