Freedom of Information Act 2000 – regulation of public spaces
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Please state whether you have used the Environmental Protection Act
1990 to restrict the distribution of free printed matter (leafleting).  If so, please state the cost of obtaining a leafleting licence. Please state whether you apply these restrictions to small local arts and community groups (for example a local theatre or arts group).

Answer:
Yes, anyone wanting to distribute free printed matter within a designated area must have consent from Leicester City Council in advance. 
According to the legislation there are exemptions for any distribution for political, charitable or religious purposes. The restrictions apply to everyone outside these exemptions. 
Details are on our website, including the scale of fees according to the number of distributors and the number of days involved: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/business/licences-and-permits/trade-and-industry/distribution-of-free-printed-materials-licensing/
This letter therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in public domain, i.e. the Council website.

2. Please state whether there are any additional restrictions in your town or city centre on leafleting on behalf of religious/charity/political groups.

There are no additional restrictions for these groups, they are currently exempt under the legislation.



3. Please state whether there are public open-air areas within your city or town centre which are owned and controlled by private companies (for example, a square or a park). If possible, please state the number of these areas. Please state whether you are aware of any restrictions in these areas upon freedom of speech or association (for example, restrictions on leafleting, political demonstrations, gathering in groups, charity fundraising, or on megaphones or amplification).

The Council does not hold a definitive list of privately owned/managed open spaces.  
Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
We are aware of the following in the city centre:

· St Peter’s Square owned and managed by Highcross Shopping Centre

· St Martin’s Square, Old Town privately owned
· Cathedral Gardens is managed on behalf of the Cathedral by St Martins House (which is an activity of the Leicester Diocese Board of Finance)
· There will be other areas such as University campuses that are managed by Leicester and De Montfort Universities themselves. 

As all these areas are privately owned, we do not hold any information on the conditions of use of these spaces which will most likely be different for each organisation.

4. Please state whether you have taken down or issued warnings for posters put up by community/religious/charitable/political groups, or for local events. Please give a list of all such posters taken down in the past year. Please provide as much detail as is possible (e.g., the name of the community group concerned, and the action taken).

We do not keep records of any posters removed specifically relating to Community/ religious/or political groups. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

We don’t get too many that would fall into this category and in nearly every case that we are aware of we have spoken to the organisation and asked them to stop fly-posting and remove any they have put up and have not had to take any enforcement action. 

There is no exemption in fly-posting law but we consider if it is in the public interest to take any enforcement action in these cases. 
5. Please state whether there is a free public noticeboard within your
town or city centre where people can put up posters.

All Libraries and community centres operated by the Council have notice boards to promote local community events and activities.


6. Please state whether your council has an area in the town centre where people could put up a temporary stall (for example, to campaign on a political cause). Would a fee be payable to the council for this? (and if so, how much?).

Yes, the below spaces are managed by festivals and events and we have premises licenses attached to these spaces:

· Clock Tower / East Gates

· Humberstone Gate West

· Gallowtree Gate

· Orton Square

· Town Hall Square

· New Market Square

· Jubilee Square

· Magazine Square 

Fees and charges for these sites is below, though if it is a religious stall there is no charge.  

If it is a protest this usually goes through the police channels, we may take documentation but we have no power to stop people protesting etc, that would be a matter for the police.

                                                

	
	Weekdays

Monday to Friday Daily Rate 
	Weekends

Saturday & Sunday

Daily Rate
	Weekly Commercial

(Mon-Sun)

	Commercial
	£500
	£900
	£3,000

	Charities
	£110
	£110
	NA

	Roaming

Must be actively roaming, no static infrastructure
	£250
	£400
	NA


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


