Freedom of Information Act 2000 – elderly care
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. How many building based day care centres for older people, aged 65 or over, are there currently in your council?

Answer:

None – there are no day care centres which the Council owns and runs for older people. We have contracted services with independent sector providers which our older service users use.

2. How many building based day care centres for older people, aged 65 or over, have been closed in the past five years?

None

3. How many older people, aged 65 or over, are currently in your council area?

43,400

4. How many older people, aged 65 or over, are currently in your council area that are eligible for the council to pay towards the cost of their care (estimate is absolutely fine)?

Total – 2,884 (2,358 without Direct Payments / 526 with Direct Payments)
5. How many older people, aged 65 or over, are receiving funding from the council for day care services?

The Council contract with providers directly (194) and also provide direct payments (142) for day care for a total of 336 service users.

6. How many older people, aged 65 or over, attended day care centres for older people in 2013, 2014, 2015, 2016, 2017 and 2018 in your council?

Number of unique clients (including those on Direct Payments), over 65, attending day centre are: 
2013/14
861 
2014/15
789 
2015/16 
647 
2016/17
578 
2017/18
526 
2018/19
453

7. What was the total number of day care visits made by all older people, aged 65 or over, to day care centres in your council in 2016, 2017 and 2018?

2016/17
1,227

2017/18
1,833

2018/19
735

8. What was the total expenditure on day care for older people, aged 65 or over, in your council in 2013, 2014, 2015, 2016, 2017 and 2018?

The Council do not hold the comparative figures for 2013/14 and 2014/15.  Therefore this part of the letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
2015/16
£1.6m 
2016/17
£1.6m 
2017/18
£1.6m  
2018/19
£1.5m 
These figures include the cost of direct payments paid to service users to buy their own day care.


9. How much funding did day care centres, for older people aged 65 or over, receive in 2013, 2014, 2015, 2016, 2017 and 2018?

The Council do not give block funding to any provider but commission services from contracted independent sector providers. The costs are as per question 8.

10. What is the process followed by the council once an older person, aged 65 or over, is deemed eligible for day care in your council?
Individuals are not deemed to be eligible for day care in our organisation, they are deemed to have eligible needs in line with the outcomes detailed in the Care Act. Once they have eligible needs, if they choose to attend a day centre, this will be facilitated as part of their support plan.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


