Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)

Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) 
· cycling improvement scheme
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. How much money was spent on cycle improvements?

Answer: 
The budget for the London Road improvements is £3.9M. 
The cycling improvements are part funded by £1.2 million from the European Regional Development Fund.


2. How many cyclists on average were using the centre roads before the road works?

Recorded cycling numbers continue to grow at an average rate of 10%+ per year with variation at specific sites and cordons. Census data, ad hoc route-user surveys, scheme specific counts and automatic counters are used to monitor growth. 
It is estimated that there are 17,000 daily cyclists across the city.


3. How many additional cyclists are now using the centre roads?

Approximately 4,500 cycling trips per day in city centre – See graph below. 
As per the comment above recorded cycling numbers continue to grow at an average rate of 10%+ per year.
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4. How much additional congestion has the scheme caused? 

The completed scheme is not expected to cause any additional congestion.


5. How much longer does it take to travel into the city because of the scheme?

We do not anticipate the completed scheme to cause an increase in journey times


6. What evidence was used to support the scheme?

Prior to the scheme, 5 year accident data for the years 2010 to 2015 was collected. 
There were approximate 100 reported injury accidents on London Road during this time period between the Waterloo Way junction and Mayfield roundabout. 
One of the key aims of the scheme was to improve safety. Public consultation on the scheme took place between 11th October and 10th November 2017. 
Of the 147 responses received 64% were supportive of the scheme, while 8% stated that they did not support the scheme. The remaining 26% of respondents did not specify whether or not they supported the scheme.  
Full results of the consultation can be found at the following link https://consultations.leicester.gov.uk/communications/london-road-improvements/
7. What evidence was presented objecting to the scheme and did you consider this?

No formal objections to the scheme have been received. 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Full results of the consultation can be found at the following link https://consultations.leicester.gov.uk/communications/london-road-improvements/
8. Please demonstrate how you have impartially considered the evidence against the scheme?

No formal objections to the scheme have been received, and the Council is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held.
A formal consultation period was held which gave the public the opportunity to make comments on the scheme.  Comments were fully considered and used to develop the detailed design for the scheme. 
Full results of the consultation can be found at the following link https://consultations.leicester.gov.uk/communications/london-road-improvements/
9. What services did you cut to pay for the cycle improvements? 

No services have been cut to pay for the cycle improvements

10. What steps will you take to ensure cyclists follow rules?

Leicester City Council undertakes cycle training in schools across the city and runs promotional campaigns and events for adult cyclists. 
Enforcement of highway law is regulated by the police and not the local authority.

11. Provide a copy of all minutes and decisions regarding the cycle improvements?

It is estimated that to collate this information would take over 19.5 hours.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, along with locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The Council has duly determined that to undertake such an exercise would exceed the cost limit specified above.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under Section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of Section 12(1) of FOIA and, Regulation 12(4)(b) of the EIR, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

12. Provide evidence of how the additional congestion has impacted your sustainability policy?

When the scheme is complete, from the modelling we have carried out, we do not anticipate any increased congestion.  
The aim of the scheme is to encourage people to walk, cycle and use public transport, thus contributing to health, environmental and sustainability targets.
13. Please provide your rationale for the cycle investments when the majority of users are car owners?

The scheme will create a much safer and more appealing route for cyclists and pedestrians whilst still retaining two lanes of traffic in each direction on London Road. 
The scheme will also introduce some much needed improvements around the major public transport interchange around the Railway Station. 
The surface of London Road was also in a poor condition, this is being resurfaced which will benefit all road users.
14. Which cycling groups have influenced your decision?

Cycling organisations along with other stakeholders and the general public were consulted on the scheme proposals.
15. Which motoring groups and businesses objected to your scheme, and explain why you ignored their concerns?
No formal objections to the scheme have been received, and the Council is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

