Freedom of Information Act 2000 – illegal traveller camp
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the following information.
You asked:
1. In the calendar year of 2018 how much has the council spent cleaning up council owned land following the eviction of an illegal traveller camp
a. Please may this be divided by site address, how long each site was occupied for and the cost site per site

2. In the calendar year of 2018 how much has the council spent on legal fees to evict illegal traveller camps

a. Please may this be divided by site address, how long each site was occupied for and the cost per site

3. In the calendar year of 2017 how much has the council spent cleaning up council owned land following the eviction of an illegal traveller camp

a.  Please may this be divided by site address, how long each site was occupied for and the cost site per site

4. In the calendar year of 2017 how much has the council spent on legal fees to evict illegal traveller camps

a. Please may this be divided by site address, how long each site was occupied for and the cost per site

5. In the calendar year of 2016 how much has the council spent cleaning up council owned land following the eviction of an illegal traveller

a. Please may this be divided by site address, how long each site was occupied for and the cost site per site

6. In the calendar year of 2016 how much has the council spent on legal fees to evict illegal traveller camps

a. Please may this be divided by site address, how long each site was occupied for and the cost site per site

7. In the calendar year of 2015 how much has the council spent cleaning up council owned land following the eviction of an illegal traveller

a. Please may this be divided by site address, how long each site was occupied for and the cost site per site

8. In the calendar year of 2015 how much has the council spent on legal fees to evict illegal traveller camps

a. Please may this be divided by site address, how long each site was occupied for and the cost site per site

Answer:
Please see information requested in the attached file.

The table lists all the unauthorised encampments for the City from 2015 to 2018 where either legal or cleaning costs have been incurred.

Leicester City Council contract the management of unauthorised encampments to Leicestershire County Council who do not record the cost of legal officer’s time in dealing with encampments.  This information is therefore not included and this part of the letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


