Freedom of Information Act 2000 – care homes inspection reports  
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the following information.
You asked:
1)  
Any Inspections reports carried out by your local authority adult social care commissioning team, into care homes (both residential and nursing) for adults. 
Answer:

The number of reports below are recorded by the calendar years
2016 – 44

2017 – 48

2018 – 46

2019 to date - 14

2)
i) Figures for how many people were enrolled in a course to achieve a basic care certificate from your local authority? 
ii) Figures for how many people gained the qualification of a basic care certificate from your local authority.
 

iii) Figures for total number of care workers working in your local authority with a basic care certificate. 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Leicester City Council do not provide a basic care course or qualification. This training is undertaken by the contracted provider by either using external trainers, on-line training, in-house induction / development or alternative methods.  

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


