Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

We are asking for information for the period 1st April 2018 to 31st March 2019 (2018/19). 
 
1. How many liability order proceedings for non-payment of council tax were commenced in 2018/19?   
Court proceedings to obtain a liability order were commenced on 27 occasions in 2018/19.
2. What was the mean average value of council tax owed for the proceedings commenced as identified in question 1? 
£459,030.
3. In 2018/19 against how many people did the local authority commence committal proceedings with regard to unpaid council tax? 
76.
4. In 2018/19 against how many people did the local authority seek attachment of earnings orders to collect unpaid council tax?  
2,940.
5. In how many cases were these attachment orders successfully made? 
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending 2.5 working days in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This information is not held in a reportable format. To provide the data requested staff would need to manually trawl each account to identify whether payments were received successfully from the employer.  There were 2,940 referrals for the 2018/19 financial year, allowing 5 minutes to trawl each case would require 245 hours of officer time.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

6. In 2018/19 against how many people did the local authority seek to collect payments directly from welfare benefits paid by the DWP with regard to unpaid council tax?  
4,519.
7. In how many cases were these requests for deductions from benefits successfully made?

Again, this information is not recorded in a reportable format and would require the manual trawl of each account.  Allowing 5 minutes per record would require 377 hours of officer time.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

8. In 2018/19 how many people did the local authority commence proceedings to make someone bankrupt due to council tax arrears?  
4.
9. What was the mean average level of council tax debt for all the people against whom these bankruptcy proceedings were successful? 
£19,387.
10. In how many cases was the bankruptcy successfully made? 
0.
11. What were the total additional charges added to the debt as a result of these successful bankruptcy proceedings including fees charged by the Insolvency Service and Insolvency Practitioners? 
Not applicable.
12. In 2018/19 how many times did the council instruct a bailiff to collect council tax arrears subject to a liability order? 
13,685.
13. What was the mean average level of the debts that led to these instructions to bailiffs?  
£603
14. What was the outcome of the council tax committal proceedings identified in question 3? 
  

20 cases were adjourned.  50 warrants backed by bail were granted by the Magistrates for people to appear at court at a later date.  6 cases were withdrawn as customers either paid in full, a payment arrangement was agreed, or an attachment to earnings or deductions from benefits were accepted in advance of the hearing. 

15. How many people were committed to prison for non-payment of council tax in 2018/19? 
0.
16. What was the overall total number of days served in prison by all of the people committed to prison for non-payment of council tax owed to the local authority in 2018/19? 
Not applicable.
17. How many people were subject to a suspended committal order due to non-payment of council tax in 2018/19? 
1.
18. How many people subject to a suspended committal order in 2018/19 were subsequently committed to prison because they did not comply with the terms of the suspended order?  
0.
19. How many people subject to a suspended committal order before 2018/19 for non-payment of council tax were committed to prison in 2018/19 because they did not comply with the terms of the suspended order? 
0.
20. In how many cases did the people subject to a committal order in 2018/19 clear the debt and avoid imprisonment?   
0.
21. In how many cases did the people subject to a committal order in 2018/19 and imprisoned subsequently clear the debt and so reduced their prison term? 
0.
22. In how many cases did people subject to a suspended committal order in 2018/19 maintain the required payments for the duration of the order or to date?  
0.
23. What was the total amount of council tax arrears owed by people subject to council tax committal proceedings in 2018/19 when the proceedings commenced?  
£266,301.17.
24. What was the total amount of council tax arrears remitted by the local authority in 2018/19 under section 13A of the local government act ? 
Leicester City Council has a council tax discretionary relief (CTDR) policy under section 76 of the Local Government Act 2003 and section 13A of the Local Government Finance Act 1992.   In 2018/19 a total of £381,618.67 was paid to customers facing severe financial hardship and whose council tax was at any stage of the recovery process.   
25. What was the total amount of council tax arrears remitted by the magistrates Court in 2018/19?  
0.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
