Freedom of Information Act 2000 – clinical staff in health visiting teams  
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information.
You asked:
Regarding the clinical staff in your health visiting teams, on 1st February of 2016, 2017, 2018 and 2019:

1. Who provided/employed the health visitors commissioned by your local authority? Please also provide their email address.

Answer:
Leicestershire Partnership NHS Trust - Mark.Roberts@leicspart.nhs.uk

2. How many whole time equivalent clinical staff (with caseloads) coded as health visitors, by NHS pay band, were employed by that organisation in your health visiting teams?

3. How many whole time equivalent clinical staff (with caseloads) who are NOT coded as health visitors, by NHS pay band, were employed by that organisation in your health visiting teams?

In respect of Qs 2 and 3, the Council does not hold this information.  We commission the service rather than specific numbers.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Please contact the Provider (email above) for this level of detailed information.
4. How many children under-5 years of age were there in your local authority area?



0-4 years old
Year

ONS mid-year estimates

Registered patients

2016


26078




26101

2017


25574




25862

2018


25049




25470

2019







24885

The Council do not hold ONS mid-year estimates.  This therefore is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.
5. Currently, who is the responsible manager for the health visiting service? Please also provide their email address.

Mark.Roberts@leicspart.nhs.uk
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


