Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Under the Freedom of Information Act, please could I request the following information: 
1)      Please provide a copy of your most up to date digital strategy document or link.
This information is not held by Leicester City Council, we do not have a strategy document.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2)      What budget is the council setting aside to invest in innovation in 2020/21, 2021/22, 2022/23?
This information is not held by Leicester City Council, the budget for 2020/21 has not been set.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3)      Please list all the digital innovation projects the council will be working on from 2020-2023. 
This information is not held by Leicester City Council, we have no definitive list.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4)      Please name the partners you are working with to deliver these projects?
Not applicable.

5)      Who is responsible for digital transformation in your organisation?

Anita Chinda, Digital Transformation Lead.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

