Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Raising Voices/Strive Women's project
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.
You asked:
Raising Voices was a project run under the Prevent programme, led locally by Will Baldet. 

Please release to me:

1: Any project documents relating to Raising Voices, including strategy documents, project outlines, and training material used for the project
2: Data related to where the training was delivered, how long for, and by whom
3: Evaluation documents related to Raising Voices
4: Any email internal correspondence regarding Raising Voices
5: Any complaints or praise received for Raising Voices

Please also detail any funding provided to Strive women through Prevent, including amount, date, and what the funding was pertaining to.

Answer:

Leicester City Council does not hold information/ data on any Prevent programmes, including “Raising Voices”.  All Prevent programmes in Leicester are managed by the St Phillips Centre.
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


