Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)
Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR)
– Dog Zones on Parks
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
implementation of Dog Zones on Parks such as locations and costs; and any revenue received from the implementation/enforcement of the Dog Fouling order. 
 

1. I wish to find out the location of all enclosed zones suitable for dog off leash exercising both on the green areas e.g. Allexton Gardens, LE3 6LA greens secure gated enclosure with dogs waste bin provided, New Park photo attached and any parks in the area for which you are responsible as a Council.

Answer:

Leicester City Council has not introduced any dedicated dog zones. 
Dogs are allowed on all parks and public open space to be exercised off lead, with the expectation of play areas and cemeteries, as per the sites contained in the dog exclusion order, see link: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/182143/dog-exclusion-order-pspo-2016.pdf 
Although some sites have dog waste bins, bagged dog waste can be disposed in any parks litter bin.

2. Please can you supply copy of the information containing costs to the Leicester City Council with breakdown by creating / maintenance/cleaning the above mentioned areas between 2016-2019 financial years.

Not applicable, see response above

 

3. Please can you  supply copy of the information containing calculations of the costs to the Leicester City Council with breakdown by creating / maintenance/cleaning the prepared / referenced in the ‘Implementation of Dog Zones on Parks (Appendix to CMB report 23/11/16)’ cited  in paragraph 3 as following : ‘The cost of creating clearly identifiable or fenced-in dog zones would be excessive, especially if ongoing cost implications of monitoring and cleaning provision is factored in.’

Data is not available from the 2016 exercise and the Council is advising you as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held.
 

4. Please can you supply exact figures of the revenue raised after implementation The PSPO for Dog Fouling only, including any enforcement costs associated with collection of penalties for breach of the Dog Fouling PSPO since first introduction and during extensions’ period of the said order.

The income generated from fixed penalty notices for dog fouling is as follows:

a. £480    - 2019 year to date

b. £880    - 2018  

c. £1,760 - 2017

The costs associated with the enforcement of the PSPO (Public Spaces Protection Order) for dog fouling is not available as this forms a small part of the role of Wardens and the time allocated to this task is not recorded.  This therefore is a refusal as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


