
Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Homeless Applications
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Over the past twelve months, how many people have made a homeless application at the Council?

Answer:

3134
2. Over the past twelve months how many people have been provided with interim accommodation pursuant to s.188 (1) of the Housing Act 1996?

735
3. Over the past twelve months, how many people have been provided with interim accommodation pursuant to s.189 (b) of the Housing Act 1996?

As above

(all applicants placed into interim accommodation would be considered to be owed the s189 Relief Duty)

4. Over the past twelve months, how many homeless applicants have had their personal property protected by the local authority?

Leicester City Council follow the Code of Guidance, and assistance would be offered when requested.  

With regards to numbers, this data is not held.  Therefore this part of the letter acts as refusal notice in accordance with section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

5. Please state the average length of time that the homeless applicant’s personal property is stored by the local authority?

6. Please provide details of the average cost of storing a homeless applicant’s personal property?

With respect to Qs 5&6 this information is not held.  This letter therefore acts as a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by Leicester City Council.

7. Under what circumstances do the local authority protect the personal property of homeless applicants?

Where we have reason to believe that:
(a) there is a danger of loss of, or damage to, the applicant’s personal property;

(b) because the applicant is unable to protect it or deal with it; and,

(c) no other suitable arrangements have been, or are being, made.
8. As part of the homeless application process does the local authority expressly ask the homeless applicant, whether they need their personal property protected?

No, not as a matter of course.  This tends to be on a case by case basis.

9. If not, please state the reasons why not?

Upon initial assessment, in depth discussions are held with all applicants who may enter temporary accommodation.  
If concerns are raised regarding the protection of property, further discussions are held on a case by case basis.

10. Please provide copies of the local authorities’ policies regarding homeless applications?

Leicester City Council hold no specific policy and advising you as required under Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.  
Officers follow the Housing Act 1996, Part 7 (as amended) and the Homelessness Code of Guidance 2018.
11. Please provide a copy of the local authorities policy regarding protecting the personal property of homeless applicants?

The Council holds no specific policy.  Officers follow the Housing Act 1996, Part 7 (as amended) s211, and the Homelessness Code of Guidance 2018, Chapter 20.

12. Please disclose a copy of the council's homeless procedures manual or policy document followed by housing solutions officer at its homeless service centres/ homeless persons offices?

Our work is carried out as per the Housing Act 1996, Part 7 (as amended) and the Homelessness Code of Guidance 2018, which govern and guide the way that homeless applications are taken and progressed.

13. Please detail over the past three years, the number of complaints that have been made by homeless applicants because of the Council’s failure to protect their personal property?

Zero
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


