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Dear Mr Thompson
Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1) Please provide me details of places, including public buildings, meeting rooms etc that have replaced, or plan to replace the words: man, men, father, dad, mankind and other male-related words with gender-neutral terms?  
Leicester City Council has not undertaken work of this kind.
 

2) Please provide me with details of the costs of making these changes?
Nil. 

 

3) Please provide me details of any council guidance on the replacement of the words man, men, father, dad, mankind and other male-related words and their replacement with gender-neutral terms?
The Council does not have specific corporate guidance on this matter.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4) Please provide with an example of a council report or publication that has replaced the words man, men, father, dad, mankind and other male-related words with a gender-neutral term?
The Council does not hold this information; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
 

5) Please provide me with details about the amount of money you authority has spent on combatting domestic abuse over each of the last 5 complete financial years, including money spent on shelters/refuges. I would like this broken down by sex?
Please find the relevant information attached.  Please note, some of the data requested is not held by Leicester City Council. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
 

6) Please provide me with details about any initiatives that have been launched to reduce male suicide over the last three years?  

 

7) Please provide me with details about any initiatives that have been launched to reduce female suicide over the last three years?  

Response to question 6 and 7.

While the local authority does not commission mental health support services, Leicester City Council’s Public Health team does work to prevent death by suicide in the city.

Leicester City Council works in partnership with Leicestershire County Council and Leicestershire Police on a suicide prevention campaign called ‘Start a Conversation: Suicide is Preventable.’ The campaign aims to combat stigma around speaking about suicidal ideation, and to promote support available in the local area. Key components of the campaign are a website with wider information and crisis signposting, and a suicide bereavement support service to emotionally support individuals who have been bereaved by a death by suicide.

 8) Please provide me with details of events held by your council, in the last three years that promote positive male role models, fatherhood and marriage?    

Leicester City Council has not held any specific events on this topic, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000   
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Yours sincerely

Pravina Chandarana
Information Governance and Risk
Tell us how we’re doing: We would be very grateful if you could answer a few short questions in this anonymous online survey about our response to you so that we can continue to improve our services.
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