Freedom of Information Act 2000 Environmental Information Regulations Act 2004

Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. How much is collected by Leicester City Council in parking fees and fines?
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain. 

Please refer to the Annual Parking Report 2019 using the following link: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/transport-and-streets/parking-in-leicester/
Regulation 6 of the Environmental Information Regulations is also engaged.  Information shall be provided in the requested form or format unless: the information is already publicly available and easily accessible to the applicant, regulation 6(1)(b).

2. How is this money spent?
3. Does the parking charges and fines result in net profit for the council once the cost of maintaining parking facilities and enforcement is removed?
Again, this information is already in the public domain. Any surplus is invested back into parking improvement projects and travel concessions. 


Please refer to the Parking Improvement Report and the Parking Improvement Consultation Document using the following link:

https://consultations.leicester.gov.uk/city-development-and-neighbourhoods/parking-improvement-plan/
4. Do any member of Leicester City Council, or staff of Leicester City Council, receive free or subsidised parking?
Yes.


5. If yes to question 4, what is the total value of the free/subsidised parking that is given? (To be clear this is the annual sum of all combined free/subsidised parking given to councillors/staff)
City Centre - free parking is provided to employees within the city centre who meet certain criteria, such as employees who need to use their car frequently for business journeys, i.e. social workers and blue badge holders.  Free parking is also provided to all councillors but not the City Mayor. 

Although information is collated with regards to who receives free parking, the value of the free parking cannot be determined due to the variety of types/location of the car parks involved and the length of each stay.  Staff would also predominantly use Leicester City Council’s own car parks at no cost to the Council.
Outside of City Centre - free parking is also available to some employees located out of the city centre where car parking facilities are available at a Council site.
Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  Regulation 12(4)(a) of the Environmental Information Regulations is also engaged, we do not hold this information.

6. If yes to question 4, is this considered a benefit in kind for tax purposes?
No.


7. If yes to question 4, what is the average wage/salary for staff/councillors receiving: (A) free parking, (B) subsidised parking,  (C) that have to pay full rates for parking
The Act relates to recorded information held and does not require the creation of new information specifically to answer a request. The average wage/salary requires staff to collate data and calculate a figure in order to respond to this question. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  Regulation 12(4)(a) of the Environmental Information Regulations is also engaged, we do not hold this information.

8. Do the expenses/allowances offered to any councillors/staff mean that they can claim the value of parking back, if so what is the value of this for all staff/councillors over the year?
Yes, over the last year, 01/11/2018 to 31/10/2019, £25,035.43 has been claimed via expenses for all council staff/councillors.

9. Who arbitrates parking fines and appeals?
Traffic Penalty Tribunal and Civil Courts hearings.

10. What percentage of parking fine appeals are upheld against (A) general members of the public and, (B) councillors/staff of Leicester City Council
This information is not held. The system used for recording parking fines does not differentiate between the general public, councillors or staff. 

Any vehicle observed to be parked illegally will be issued a penalty charge notice.  Any forthcoming correspondence received in relation to the issuing of a PCN is logged directly against the PCN and the name provided at the time or by the DVLA as the registered keeper of the vehicle. 

Please refer to the Annual Parking Report 2019 using the following link for statistics on appeals: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/transport-and-streets/parking-in-leicester/
Again, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.  Regulation 12(4)(a) of the Environmental Information Regulations is also engaged, we do not hold this information.


11. Can you please provide a map detailing the location of CCTV cameras operated by Leicester City Council
An exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain. 

https://data.leicester.gov.uk/explore/dataset/cctv-cameras/map/?location=12,52.69434,-1.11585&basemap=jawg.streets 

Regulation 6 of the Environmental Information Regulations is also engaged.  Information shall be provided in the requested form or format unless: the information is already publicly available and easily accessible to the applicant, regulation 6(1)(b).

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
