Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.
You asked:

Please can you provide the following information:

(i) the number of non-domestic rateable office properties within your local authority and the total floorspace of these properties

(ii) the number of non-domestic rateable office properties within your local authority which have either been demolished or converted to other uses and the total floorspace of these properties 

(iii) in relation to the properties in point (ii) - the number of non-domestic rateable properties (by sector and sub-sector) which the properties have been developed or converted into and the total floorspace of these properties 

(iv) the number of non-domestic rateable industrial properties within your local authority and the total floorspace of these properties

(v) the number of non-domestic rateable industrial properties within your local authority which have either been demolished or converted to other uses and the total floorspace of these properties

(vi) in relation to the properties in point (v) - the number of non-domestic rateable properties (by sector and sub-sector) which the properties have been developed or converted into and the total floorspace of these properties

Please can you provide a yearly breakdown of the data requested above, starting from the year 2000 (or from the point data is available, if later) to the latest available data for 2019?

This information is not held by Leicester City Council, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You will need to contact the Valuation office as follows:

VALUATION OFFICE AGENCY 

ROSEBERY COURT 

CENTRAL AVENUE 

ST ANDREWS BUSINESS PARK 

NORWICH 

NR7 0HS

TELEPHONE:                          03000 501501

E-MAIL:                                                ratingeast@voa.gsi.gov.uk 
WEBSITE:                                www.voa.gov.uk
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ

e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
