Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)

Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) 
– planning applications, student housing 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.
You asked:
For 2019 please send me: 

1. A list of high rise building* planning applications submitted to the council with the intended purpose of student housing (excel spreadsheet) 

2. The planning application submitted to the council for each high rise building* intended for student housing (.pdf format) 

For 2018 please send me: 

3. A list of high rise building* planning applications submitted to the council with the intended purpose of student housing (excel spreadsheet) 

4. The planning application submitted to the council for each high rise building* intended for student housing (.pdf format) 

For 2017 please send me: 

5. A list of high rise building* planning applications submitted to the council with the intended purpose of student housing (excel spreadsheet) 

6. The planning application submitted to the council for each high rise building* intended for student housing (.pdf format) 

*Please note, a high rise building refers to any building five stories or above.
Answer:
The Council’s system does not record building heights in a format that can be searched for or so collated. 
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, this information is not held by the Council at the time of request.

To advise and assist you further with this, you can search the public online register of applications for student accommodation and go through the publicly available records held on our website by entering the word ‘student’ into the description of development box in the advanced search box on https://planning.leicester.gov.uk/
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


