Freedom of Information Act 2000 – homelessness applications
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. The number of refugees provided with temporary accommodation by you, because their asylum support came to an end and they would otherwise have become homeless, between March 2018 and March 2019;

Answer:
60

2. The number of applications made by refugees for local authority housing to you, between March 2018 and March 2019;

The Council do not record information regarding immigration status of people making an application for housing.  Checks are only done at the point of offer.  This information is not held and this is therefore a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. The number of homelessness applications made by refugees to you, between March 2018 and March 2019.


84
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


