Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Under the Freedom of Information Act, please can you give me details on the amount of money spent hiring celebrities. They may have been hired to present awards, record video/audio clips, turn on Christmas lights, visit a local school or for any other purpose.
For each of the last five years (2019, 2018, 2017, 2016 and 2015), please state:

1) Which celebrity was hired to make an appearance.
Des Coleman.

2) What they were hired to do.
To host the Annual Celebrating Success Event for Looked After Children


3) When they were hired.
2015/16.


4) How much they were paid.
This information is not recorded as the celebrity was not directly employed by Leicester City Council. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

5) If they were given anything in lieu of payment – eg night in a hotel, cab fares etc
This information is not recorded as the celebrity was not directly employed by Leicester City Council. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6) In some instances a celebrity may have asked the money be paid to charity. If you have a record of this, please say how much and which charity.
This information is not recorded as the celebrity was not directly employed by Leicester City Council. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Christmas Lights.

£0 for each year as we do not pay for celebrities to switch on our lights. The stars of the De Montfort Hall Pantomime take part in the event alongside the Lord Mayor.  However, they do this as part of their obligations as performers and are not paid for attending. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

