Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Supported Accommodation
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
For background information it relates to supported accommodation for homeless individuals/families. By ‘Supported Accommodation’ I mean individuals who are homeless in either temporary accommodation or independent accommodation.

 

The request is specific to provision of accommodation/housing for homeless adults. 

 

1. A list of every support provider who operates in your Local Authority.

Answer:
Leicester City Council does not hold a comprehensive list of all support providers operating in the local authority area. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

However, the providers worked closely with are:

Action Homeless - 10 Saint James Terrace, Leicester. LE2 1NA.

Leicester YMCA - Easter St, Leicester.

Adullam Homes - 25 Tarragon Rd, Leicester LE2 7ET

East Midland Housing - Memorial House, Stenson Road, Coalville. LE67 4JP 

Amicus Trust – 31A Prebend Street, Bedford MK40 1QN

Help the Homeless - 9 Abbey St, Leicester. LE1 3TE

One Roof Leicester- 7 Peacock Ln, Leicester. LE1 5PZ

P3 (People Potential Possibilities) - Eagle House Cotmanhay Road, Ilkeston, Derbyshire DE7 8HU

The Bridge Homelessness to Hope - 43 Melton St, LE1 3NB

2. A list of every supported accommodation (for homeless) provider who operates under your local authority.

Those providers, that the authority works closely with are:

Action Homeless - 10 Saint James Terrace, Leicester. LE2 1NA.

Leicester YMCA - Easter St, Leicester.

Adullam Homes - 25 Tarragon Rd, Leicester LE2 7ET

East Midland Housing - Memorial House, Stenson Road, Coalville. LE67 4JP 

Amicus trust – 31A Prebend Street, Bedford MK40 1QN

The Local Authority does not hold information on non-commissioned supported accommodation for the homeless.  This therefore is a refusal as required by Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.
3. The procedure for getting referrals? These can be in the form of a framework, spot contract and/or advertisement (pro contract, chest, etc.)
The Single Access and Referral Service (SAR) is a single point of access to the Councils funded housing related support service. It is part of the wider Housing Options service and will contribute to the prevention of homelessness.  
Referrals for temporary accommodation are emailed into the SAR Team, who will then arrange for referrals to be sent onto the most appropriate commissioned provider. 
Commissioned providers are not supported housing, but will provide support to the applicant where necessary.

4. Number of users under provision in borough

The Local Authority does not have universal information about the number of users ‘under provision in the borough’. Therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.

In commissioned temporary accommodation, approximately 200 singles and 80 families are accommodated and supported.  This is only a small number as the Authority does not have information on other providers who offer just support provision across the Authority.

5. Number of users placed out of borough

The Local authority does not ‘place out of the borough’ but when individuals are referred to a refuge they may be ‘out of area’, but specific numbers are not held and this is a refusal notice in accordance with Section 1.1 of the FOI Act.
6. Number of users on waiting lists

This information is not held by the Council and is advising you in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act.

The Local Authority does not maintain waiting lists for commissioned accommodation.  
Any such lists held by non-commissioned support providers is not held by the Authority.

7. What is the range of Housing Benefit awarded? 

Supported homeless accommodation as of November 2019 – ranged from £37.41 to £421.93 per week in Housing Benefit.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


