Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)

Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR)

– Highways S278 and S38 agreements
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds
the information requested.
You asked:
Highway Bond Provision 
1.Please could you confirm what are the individual elements that your Authority includes within their bond requirement for all highways work for S278 and S38 agreements?

Answer:
In principle all highway elements within scope of the agreement as per the Highways Act 1980

2.Please could you provide an average value for bond provision for S278 and S38agreements?

The Council does not hold average values.
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, this information is not held by the Council. 

3.Please confirm what items of highway apparatus currently attract commuted sums, and what are the individual costs?

The legal basis: Circular 1/97 Planning Obligations refers to the payment of

commuted maintenance sums where specifically provided for in legislation (the Highways Act 1980) and any subsequent amendments or case law.

4.Would you consider using the developer obtained tender value for calculating the bond provision for S278 and S38 agreements?

Our position is the Council will work out the construction cost for the works.
5.Please could you confirm your inspection fee or percentage applicable relevant to the bond provision for S278 and S38 agreements?
This information is publicly available at: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/181997/minor-fees-and-charges-for-transportation-services-2019-2020.pdf
The Council here applies the exemption to disclosure contained at Section 21 of the FOIA and Regulation 6 (1)(b) of EIR -Information accessible to the applicant by other means/available in another form/format.
Highway S38/S278 Timescale 
Section S278 Agreements relating to residential developments during each of the past 5 financial years. 

1. Please could you confirm the average time taken from technical submission to the issue of a technical approval? 

2. Please could you confirm what is the average time from technical approval to the completion of a Section 278 legal agreement? i.e. legal engrossment? 

In respect of Qs 1 and 2 above, the Council does not hold information on average values.  This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA because, in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, this information is not held by the Council. 

3. Please could you confirm the average time to grant a Streetworks Permit, post execution of the document in question 2? 

	
	Required notice period
	Response time

	Major
	3 months Provisional Advance Authorisation, 10 working days Permit
	1 month for Provisional Advance Authorisation, 5 working days for Permit


4. What in your opinion is an appropriate timescale for the submission and financial execution of a S38/ 278 Agreement? 

5. What improvements do you think could be made to the overall process from submission to engrossment? 

In respect of Qs 4 & 5, this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the FOIA and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR as the Council does not hold any recorded information.
6. Section 38 Road Adoptions relating to residential developments during each of the past 5 financial years. 
a. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken: 

b. from technical submission to technical approval to; 

c. completion of a Section 38 legal agreement to; 

d. commencement of the maintenance period to; 

e. the date of formal adoption to; 

f. notification that any bond can be cancelled. 
The Council does not hold information on average values, therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held. 
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


