Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Neighbourhood Services Grant Funding.
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested as follows:
In section 3.1 the report refers to “a corporate review of the council’s voluntary sector provision in 2004”- we would like a copy of the review documentation.
The Council has been unable to locate the information as it is no longer held. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with this section of the Act, this information is not held.
In 3.2 “A review of these agreements was carried out by Community Services in 2012”. “future needs and demands for service can be considered in the context of priorities through the TNS programme”. We would like to see the documentation relating to these reviews and where are the priorities of the TNS programme detailed?
The Council has been unable to locate information as it is no longer held. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with this section of the Act, this information is not held
3.6 “Robust and evidence-based review of the organisations”- where is the evidence of this?

The Service Analysis Team Report for Saffron Lane Neighbourhood Council is attached.
3.7 “March 2017 the city mayor and executive approved an approach to consult with the voluntary organisations”. Where is the copy of the decision and the report that was submitted in respect of this approach?
No formal decision is required for an approach of this kind. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with this section of the Act, this information is not held
We have been advised to raise concerns relating, in particular to the following points:

3.6 As a result, the approach presented below seeks to determine through a robust and evidence-based review of seven organisations:
· Achievement of the anticipated 30% (£109k) savings earmarked by the TNS programme by March 2018. 
The TNS programme reported that costs would be reduced by altering the use of buildings where in the report does it state that savings would be achieved by ceasing funding to these seven organisations?

· Ensure that the Council treats these seven organisations fairly and on a similar footing to other grant funded organisations across the city
“on a similar footing to other grant funded organisations across the city”. What other grant funded organisations across the city are you referring to that may be on a similar footing to those which you refer to in this report? How would they be similar? Are they funded from the same capital funds- if so, why are they not facing cuts in the same way that the seven organisations in this report.? If they are funded from a different source, how can they be on a similar footing?

The Neighbourhood Services Grant Funding Decision Report 29 Jan 2018 is attached.  All seven grant funded organisations are listed in section 3.1.  All executive decision reports dealing with other Council funded VCS organisations are all a matter of public record and can be found on the Council’s website. This information is therefore exempt from release under section 21 of the FOIA – accessible by other means - and can be found under executive decisions here:
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/decisions-meetings-and-minutes/
3.7 in March 2017 the City Mayor and Executive approved an approach to consult with the voluntary organisations as follows. Where is the copy of the decision and report submitted in respect of the approach that was to form a “consultation”? If the decision had already been made that a reduction of 30% needed to be made, surely this suggests that this was not a consultation?
No formal decision is required for an approach of this kind. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with this section of the Act, this information is not held
3.8 The purpose of the review was to assess the efficiency and effectiveness of the seven organisations which have been funded by Community Services and lately Neighbourhood Services over a number of years. In particular the request was to assess their future potential to be self-sustainable in light of expected reductions to the Councils budget, and how near to that they were in the current climate. As I personally liaised with the Service Analysis Team, I do not remember any conversations about how we would replace City Council Funding and make this piece of grant funded work sustainable. Your report states that the purpose of the review was to assess the efficiency and effectiveness of the service. Where is the assessment of our efficiency and effectiveness? Apart from a brief paragraph which describes how our service rents out some of the rooms in our building, there is no apparent review of our service and what is provided to the local community, nor how efficient or affective it is.

The Service Analysis Team report for Saffron Lane Neighbourhood Council was shared with the organisation and signed by them. The report is attached.  Any additional information is asking for an opinion and not for information held and is not a valid information request under the FOI Act.

5.4 Our Public Sector Equality Duty is a continuous duty, and consideration as to potential equalities impact should be considered throughout the process of developing a proposal and reaching a decision. Our project provides support services to the most vulnerable in society and by default most of these clients come under all of the protected characteristics.  In your equality Impact assessment document, updated on 24/01/2018, point 1 states “Will current service users’ needs continue to be met?” Where in your report does it address how our service will be changed and how service users’ needs will continue to be met?
The full EIA submitted with the decision report is attached.

How has your equalities impact statement addressed the potential loss of the only remaining advice service in the area?

The full EIA submitted with the decision report is attached.

How does the decision to cut funding without consulting service users to establish their continuing needs fit in with the Councils duty regarding section 149 of the Equality Act section (b) Advance equality of opportunity between protected groups and others?
The full EIA submitted with the decision report is attached.

Any personal data of individuals other than senior managers or elected members has been redacted. This is exempt from release under Section 40(2) of the FOI Act – Personal Data.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


