Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:

1. What is the email address of the person in your organisation who is responsible for the management of Subject Access Requests / DPA Requests? 
Lynn Wyeth, Head of Information Governance & Risk and Data Protection Officer

Email(s): info.requests@leicester.gov.uk  & data-protection-officer@leicester.gov.uk 

2. What percentage of Subject Access Requests (SARs) have been responded to on time since 25th May 2018? If you do know have this figure please provide a figure for what you do have.

SARS received since 25th May 2018 (including CCTV requests that are processed as SARS)

25th May – 31st December 2018 – 165 SAR & 80 CCTV (total: 245) = 8 LATE = 96.8%

1st Jan – 18th December 2019 – 289 SAR & 124 CCTV (total: 413) = 1 LATE = 99%
3. On average how many SAR/DPA requests does your authority receive in a month?
We do not hold data on averages, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4. How many SAR officers are employed by your organisation who work on Subject Access Requests?

We cannot provide the number of people within the organisation who are employed to work on Subject Access Requests. 
In the central Information Governance and Risk team, there are 7 members of staff who split their time between Freedom of Information, Data Protection, Data Breaches, CCTV, Information Sharing and Data Privacy Impact Assessment requests. There are also staff within their service areas who, alongside their normal work duties, handle SAR requests as and when they are received by that specific service area.
5. What is the generic email address of the team which deals with SARs / DPA requests within your organisation?

AccessToRecordsInbox@leicester.gov.uk – Deal with SARs for Children’ Social Care & Safeguarding/Looked after Children
Info.requests@leicester.gov.uk – Deal with all other SARs across the authority
6. How many overdue Subject Access Requests do you currently have?

Zero

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ

e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
