Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)

Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) - recycling
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. The most recent figures for the number of street bins in your council / authority area
i) in total
Answer:

1,595 litter bins. 
All waste collected is transferred to the Biffa ‘ball mill’ for sorting. Metal cans – both aluminium and steel – are extracted for recycling, food waste goes for composting at the Wanlip plant and paper and plastics go to ‘energy from waste’ plants in the UK, where they are used to create electricity for the National Grid. 

ii) that can be used for recycling
None

2. How much green bin waste (in tonnes) in your council /authority area was actually recycled in:
i) 2017
ii) 2018
iii) 2019
3. How much recycling (in tonnes) in your council /authority area was rejected in:
i) 2017
ii) 2018
iii) 2019
In respect of Qs 2 and 3, this data is publicly available on the WasteDataFlow portal, which can be accessed by visiting https://www.wastedataflow.org/login.aspx
This therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 21 of the FOIA and Regulation 6 (1) (b) of EIR, namely the information is made publicly accessible to the applicant by other means/ in another form or format.

4. The number of complaints for missed bin collections in your council / authority area in:
i) 2017

3,370

ii) 2018
2,435

iii) 2019
2,059 (9 months. Full year data not yet available and the Council is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held)

5. How much recycling (in tonnes) in your council / authority area was sent out of the United Kingdom in:

i) 2017
ii) 2018
iii) 2019
This data is publicly available on the WasteDataFlow portal, which can be accessed by visiting https://www.wastedataflow.org/login.aspx
6. How much did the council /authority spend on litter waste in:
i) 2017
ii) 2018
iii) 2019
Leicester City Council do not record this information centrally.  There are various littler streams, between numerous services where the information could be held.  
To comply with this request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit. 
Section 12 of the FOIA makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This part of the letter is therefore a Refusal Notice under Section 17(1) of the FOIA because an exemption under Section 12(1) of the Act (over the cost limit) is being applied. 

The Council also judges that the following exception to disclosure is also applicable under the EIR.  Regulation 12(4)(b) provides that a public authority may refuse to disclose information to the extent that the request for information is manifestly unreasonable and Leicester City Council consider that this exception applies in this case.

While under the EIR there is no appropriate cost limit above which authorities are not required to deal with requests for information, the ICO’s guidance on regulation 12(4)(b) states ‘In assessing whether the cost, or the amount of staff time involved in responding to a request, is sufficient to render a request manifestly unreasonable the FOIA fees regulations may be a useful starting point’.

It is estimated that the time it would take to locate, retrieve and extract the information requested would considerably exceed the appropriate limit for a FOIA request of £450 or 18 hours of staff time.

Therefore, Leicester City Council considers that the exception contained in Regulation 12(4)(b) of the EIR is engaged.
7. According to the most recent figures, what is the council's or authority's capacity for recycling (in tonnes) for the following types of material:

i) glass

ii) plastic

iii) wood

iv) aluminium

v) paper

vi) cardboard

vii) steel

viii) clothing and textiles

The Council does not have specific limits on the above materials that it can accept. 
Household waste and recycling collection and disposal services are provided by our contractor, who sources appropriate offtakers to cover demand as required. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


