Freedom of Information Act 2000 – social care needs assessment
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. In the financial years 2015/16, 2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19 for people aged 65 and over in your area, please provide the average (arithmetic mean) time in days between the request for a social care needs assessment and the needs assessment being completed, as well as the longest and shortest wait experienced by any individual in the table below.

Answer:
Our answer is based upon number of days between the start and end dates of an assessment. 
Examination of our reports shows that our longest recorded timespans between assessments start and end dates are exceptional when compared to timespans for most cases. It should be noted that assessments may not be completed due to factors beyond the Council’s control, such as the individual’s absence, hospitalisation or unwillingness to engage. Cases may also have been regularly worked on during the period but an assessment process not completed due to these or other exceptional circumstances.
	 
	Longest time (days)
	Shortest time (days)
	Arithmetic mean time (days)

	2015/16
	449
	0
	15

	2016/17
	433
	0
	12

	2017/18
	405
	0
	8

	2018/19
	347
	0
	11


2.
For the requests for care and support from new clients in the financial years 2015/16, 2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19, and for the people aged over 65 in your area, please provide the average (arithmetic mean) time in days between the social care needs assessment and the commencement of a planned care package (we refer to a planned care package as formal care services, not universal services or signposting), as well as the longest and shortest wait experienced by any individual in the table below:
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

While we monitor timescales of other parts of the pathway, including completed assessments, we do not measure the time taken to implement a care package following a decision that an individual is eligible for care and support.

	 
	Longest wait (days)
	Shortest wait (days)
	Arithmetic mean wait (days)

	2015/16
	 
	 
	 

	2016/17
	 
	 
	 

	2017/18
	 
	 
	 

	2018/19
	 
	 
	 


3. For the longest wait in days, as referenced in questions 1 &2, please provide what reasons were recorded for these delays in providing a social care needs assessment and/or social care support? 

This information is not held by the Council and is advising you as required by Section 1(1) of the Act. 

We do not systematically record the reasons for any delay experienced in receiving a social care needs assessment, even on individual case records.
4. If you do not capture data in relation to questions 1 & 2, please state your policy on how the local authority monitors and ensures reasonable time between assessment as eligible for social care support and receipt of a corresponding care package.

There is currently no policy on how the Authority monitors and ensures reasonable time between assessment as eligible for social care support and receipt of a corresponding care package.  This therefore is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held.
5. Please provide the percentage of adults over 65 receiving long-term care and support, who received a planned review within the timeframe set by the council’s care and support plan review policy in 2015/16, 2016/17, 2017/18, 2018/19 in the table below?
The figures below are snapshots taken at the end of each of the financial years for which data are requested.

	 
	Percentage of adults who received a planned review within council set timeframe

	2015/16
	Data not available

	2016/17
	70.4%

	2017/18
	74.0%

	2018/19
	71.9%


6. According to the council’s policy, how often should people receiving long term care and support receive a planned review of their care and support plan?
We aim to meet the expectation set out in the Care Act 2014 that we should conduct a review of the plan no later than every 12 months.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 


