Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

If Leicester City Council has entered into a LOBO Loan, please provide the following information:


1. How many LOBO loans has Leicester City Council entered into?
7, although most have now been repaid.

2. In relation to question 1 above, in respect of each LOBO Loan: 
a. On what date was the loan documentation signed?
Please see table below. In one case the data held is the date the loan was advanced as we no longer hold the date the loan documentation was signed.

Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

b. Which financial institutions acted as the lenders?
Please see the table below.


c. Did you receive any financial advice before entering into the LOBO Loan, and if so, from which organisation? 
This information is no longer held; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

d. Has the lender exercised their option under the LOBO Loan and increased the interest rate?

No.
3. If the answer to question 2(d) above is yes, did Leicester City Council opt to continue with the LOBO loan at the increased rate of interest, or repay the loan? 
Not applicable.

4. If the answer to question 3 above is that Leicester City Council opted to repay the loan, were any early repayment penalties applied by the lender?

Not applicable.
	BARCLAYS
	12/09/2002
	This is the date our treasury system indicates the loan was advanced.

	Dresdner Bank
	26/02/2004
	

	Dresdner Bank
	26/02/2004
	

	Dresdner Bank
	26/02/2004
	

	Danske
	23/02/2004
	

	Dexia
	26/02/2004
	

	BARCLAYS
	12/03/2007
	


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

