Freedom of Information Act 2000 – homelessness housing
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:

1. Do you have a specific framework for homelessness housing solutions? If so, is this an open or a closed framework?
Answer:

Leicester City Council’s two main options for homelessness housing solutions are the use of private rented accommodation within the City and Social Housing.  You clarified that you were interested in both elements and were not interested in information regarding temporary or interim accommodation options.

Regarding social housing we operate our own stock, and work in partnership with Registered Providers, many of whom advertise some or all of their stock through our Leicester HomeChoice website via nomination agreements.  There is no framework for this, and Service Level Agreements are put in place on an individual basis with organisations that are registered providers of social housing in the district.

Regarding private rented sector solutions, we have a range of different incentive schemes that are available for landlords to assist in securing accommodation for people that are homeless/threatened with homelessness. 

The schemes are flexible, and we can offer long-term leasing solutions, rent deposits and rent guarantees, as well as payment of a deposit, advance rent, or finders fees.

As such, there is no specific framework for homelessness housing solutions.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

2. Could you provide an indication of the minimum, maximum and average core rent you paid for homelessness rents?

Regarding Private Sector Rents, please see below minimum, maximum and average core rent paid by property size:

Property Type           Minimum rent            Average Rent           Maximum Rent

1 bed                          £375 pcm                   £375 pcm                   £475 pcm

2 bed                          £475 pcm                   £600 pcm                   £650 pcm

3 bed                          £565 pcm                   £650 pcm                   £750 pcm

4 bed                          £700 pcm                   £750 pcm                   £900 pcm

Regarding LCC-owned Social Housing Rents, please see below average core rent paid by property size:

Property Type           Average Weekly Rent  

Bedsits                       £53.20 pw                 

1 bed                          £61.56 pw     

2 bed                          £72.63 pw

3 bed                          £80.32 pw

4 bed                          £92.32 pw

5 bed                          £100.02 pw

6 bed                          £115.32 pw

7 bed                          £132.19 pw

Regarding Registered Provider-owned Social Housing Rents, LCC do not hold this information.

3. Are you able to supply the names of Private Housing Providers who provide homeless accommodation in your area?

We work with individual private landlords and local letting agents within the City. 

Names of individual landlords are withheld from disclosure as the Council considers that it is covered by the exemption contained at Section 40.2 and the first condition of (3) of the Act - Personal Information, where disclosure under the Act would breach Data Protection principles, specifically the first and second principles, those of fair, lawful and transparent processing, and those of processing for specified, legitimate and explicit purposes respectively.

Below are the name of the agents that the Council work with regularly: 

Ace Properties

Armani Brothers

Bradgate Lettings

Express Properties

Sisodia Estates

Northwood Residential Lettings

Prestige Properties

Shonki Bros

PSR Estates

Property Base

MCL Property

Leicester Lettings

Moore & Yorke

Haart Residential lettings

Butlins Property Services

Connells estate Agents

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

