Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

1. Please would you provide the following information. How many 2 year olds have been provided with free nursery education places by your local authority in each of the following three categories since 30 August 2019 : 

- Their parents claim support under section 4 of the Immigration and Asylum Act 1999;
We have had 2.

- They would be entitled to free early education provision if the normal financial criteria under the Local Authority (Duty to Secure Early Years Provision Free of Charge) Regulations 2014 were applied and their parents were entitled to access public funds, and the parents either

(a) satisfy the criteria for a derivative right to reside under regulation 16(5) of the Immigration (European Economic Area) Regulations 2016 whether or not they have applied to the Home office for confirmation of that status (which includes Zambrano carers); or
We have had 1.

(b) have been granted leave to remain on Article 8 private and family life grounds, but with a condition of no recourse to public funds.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This information is not recorded in a reportable format, we do not record data under this criterion.  Therefore, to provide the details requested would require the manual trawl of all applications for nursery place funding.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

2. Please could you also tell us:

(a) how many requests for funding for free nursery education for two year olds you have received from each of the groups specified in question 1 since August 30th 2019; and 

(b) how many of those requests were successful. 
The 3 children identified were successful.


3. Please could you also tell us:

(a) what steps you take to publicise free nursery education for two year olds;
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.

This is published through children’s centres in localities and detailed via our family information website pages accessed via the following link:-

https://families.leicester.gov.uk/family-information/childcare/funded-early-education/two-year-olds/
The Children Centres use social media every term and advertise on their Face Book pages.

 
(b) whether you undertake any specific outreach activities to try and ensure that families with 2 year old children who may benefit from free nursery education know about the entitlement and, if so, what are those activities?
We have provided briefings and information on entitlement to staff at job centre plus, children’s centres and health teams.  These are staff who work directly with parents and families and signpost accordingly.
Children Centres admin staff directly contact families known to the centres by phone to inform them of their possible entitlement and what they need to do to find out if they are eligible. 


(c) are of those activities which you have identified in your answer to 3.2 aimed at any specific groups and, if so, which groups, and which activities target them?

Children known to the Children’s Centres but not accessing two-year FEEE may be invited to some of our language focused groups. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

